
  
 

IF YOU WISH TO ADDRESS THE CITY COUNCIL, 
PLEASE COMPLETE FORM LOCATED ON DESK AT ENTRANCE AND PASS TO MAYOR. 

 
 

AGENDA – CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
June 14, 2016 

6:30 p.m. 
 
 

1. CALL TO ORDER. 
 

2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE – Invocation by Freddie Dancy, 2nd Ward City 
Councilmember. 

 
3. ROLL CALL. 
 
4. ADOPTION OF AGENDA. 
 
5. CITIZEN COMMENTS (3-Minute Limit). 

 
6. PRESENTATIONS/PROCLAMATIONS. 

 
A. Special Tribute – Great Lakes Caring Home Health & Hospice. 

The Mayor and City Council will present a Special Tribute honoring 
William Deary, Chief Executive Officer of Great Lakes Caring Home 
Health & Hospice, for economic development growth  and commitment to 
the City of Jackson. 
 

7. PETITIONS & COMMUNICATION (Accept & Place on File). 
 

8. CONSENT CALENDAR. 
 
A. Minutes of the Regular City Council Meeting of May 24, 2016: 

Approve the minutes of the regular City Council meeting of May 24, 2016. 
 

B. DDA Appointment: 
Mayor’s recommendation to appoint Charles George Dunigan to the 
Downtown Development Authority, filling a current vacancy, beginning 
immediately, and ending March 31, 2018. 
 
 
 



C. CDBG and HOME Financial Statements through May 31, 2016: 
Receive the Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) and HOME 
Financial Summaries through May 31, 2016. 
 

D. Special Event Application for Activate Jackson 2016: Lighter, Quicker, 
Cheaper Placemaking: 
Consider a request from the Jackson Area Association of Realtors to 
conduct its 3rd Annual Activate Jackson 2016: Lighter, Quicker, Cheaper 
Placemaking in downtown Jackson at the Grand River Farmers Market 
and Park. 
 
 

9. PUBLIC HEARINGS. 
 
 

10. OTHER BUSINESS. 
 
A. Ordinance No. 2016-12 – Building Code Board of Examiners and 

Appeals Membership (Second/Final Reading). 
Recommendation:  Final adoption of Ordinance No. 2016-12, amending 
Chapter 5, Article 2, City Code, to reduce the minimum number of 
members on the Building Code Board of Examiners and Appeals (BCBEA) 
from seven (7) to five (5), to change some of the requirements to be a 
member on the board, and to permit the Building Code Board of 
Examiners and Appeals to act as the City’s Construction Board of 
Appeals. 

 
B. Revised Final Allocation of HOME Investment Partnerships Program  

Funds for FY 2016-17. 
Recommendation:  Approve the revised final allocation of HOME 
Investment Partnerships Program (HOME) Funds for Fiscal Year 2016-
2017, and authorize the Mayor to sign the required documents for 
submission to HUD. 
 
 

11. NEW BUSINESS. 
 
A. Resolution – Reimbursement for Street Improvement Projects. 

Recommendation:  Approve the Reimbursement Resolution for the 
special assessment portion of Street Improvement Projects. 
 

B. Resolution – MDOT Contract For Street Reconstruction-Mechanic Street 
from Morrell Street to Washington Avenue. 
Recommendation:  Approve a resolution to enter into a contract with the 
Michigan Department of Transportation (MDOT) for street reconstruction 
on Mechanic Street from Morrell Street to Washington Avenue, and 
authorize the Mayor and City Treasurer/Clerk to execute the appropriate 
documents. 



 
C. Ordinance – Fire Prevention and Protection (First Reading). 

Recommendation:  Consider an ordinance amending Chapter 10, City 
Code, to adopt language from the International Code Council’s 2015 
International Fire Code. 
 

D. Ordinance – NOORP Registration and Inspection Cycle (First Reading). 
Recommendation:  Consider an ordinance amending Chapter 14, Sections 
14-9.1 and 14-42.1, City Code, to eliminate the optional three year non-
owner occupied residential property registration and inspection cycle. 
 

E. Street Sweeping Contract. 
Recommendation:  Award a street sweeping contract to National 
Industrial Maintenance, Inc., Dearborn, in the amount of $74,202.00 per 
sweeping cycle. 
 

F. Annual Purchase of Water and Wastewater Treatment Chemicals. 
Recommendation:  Award the various water and wastewater treatment 
chemical purchases, as presented via the annual supply bid. 
 

G. Establishment of a Public Hearing - PA 255 Commercial Redevelopment 
District. 
Recommendation:  Establish a public hearing for the City Council 
meeting on June 28, 2016, to establish a Commercial Redevelopment 
District within the area bounded by Louis Glick, North Jackson, Pearl 
Street, and Blackstone, along with the City owned property in the block 
south. 
 

*H. Demolition Contract. 
 Recommendation:  Award a Demolition Contract in the total amount of 

$279,040.00 to Smalley Construction through the Help for Hardest Hit 
Blight Elimination Program. 
 

*I. Ordinance – Employee Retirement System (ERS) Pension. 
  
  

*12. EXECUTIVE SESSION to discuss collective bargaining. (Roll call vote) 
 

*13. RETURN TO OPEN SESSION. 
 

14. CITY COUNCILMEMBERS’ COMMENTS. 
 
15. MANAGER’S COMMENTS. 
 
16. ADJOURNMENT. 

 
 

*Agenda Item added. 





 
 
 

 CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
May 24, 2016 

 
 

CALL TO ORDER: 
 
 The Jackson City Council met in regular session in the City Hall and was called 
to order at 6:30 p.m. by Mayor Bill Jors. 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE – INVOCATION:  
 

The Council joined in the Pledge of Allegiance.  Invocation was given by Arlene 
Robinson, 1st Ward City Councilmember. 
 
ROLL CALL: 
 

Present:  Mayor Bill Jors, Councilmembers Arlene Robinson, Freddie Dancy, 
Daniel P. Greer, Craig Pappin, and Derek J. Dobies.  Absent and excused:  Andrew R. 
Frounfelker. 

  
Also present:  City Manager Patrick Burtch, City Attorney Bethany Smith, City 

Treasurer/Clerk Andrew J. Wrozek, Jr., Assistant City Manager/Operations 
Jonathan Greene, Director of Police and Fire Matthew Heins, City Assessor David 
Taylor, and Director of Neighborhood and Economic Operations Jennifer Morris. 

 
ADOPTION OF AGENDA: 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Robinson, seconded by Councilmember 
Dancy to adopt the Agenda.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, 
Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember 
Frounfelker (1). 

 
CITIZEN COMMENTS:   
 

Public comment time was opened.  Comments were heard and the meeting 
resumed. 

 
 
 
 



2 
May 24, 2016 

PRESENTATIONS/PROCLAMATIONS: 
 

A. Special Tribute Recognizing Years of Service on the DDA - Robert L. 
Simmons: 
The Mayor presented a Special Tribute to Robert L. Simmons for his 
dedicated service to the City of Jackson on the Downtown Development 
Authority. 
 

PETITIONS & COMMUNICATION:  none. 
 

CONSENT CALENDAR: 
 
A. Minutes of the Regular Meeting of May 10, 2016: 

Approve the minutes of the regular City Council meeting of May 10, 2016. 
 

B. Minutes of the Special Meeting of May 17, 2016: 
Approve the minutes of the Special City Council meeting of May 17, 2016. 
 

C. DDA Resignation: 
 Receipt with regret the resignation from Robert L. Simmons from the 

Downtown Development Authority effective May 1, 2016. 
 
D. City of Jackson Building Authority Reappointment: 

Mayor’s recommendation to reappoint Philip Hones to the City of Jackson 
Building Authority for a three-year term, beginning July 1, 2016, and 
ending June 30, 2019. 
 

E. Juneteenth: 
Approve a request from Jackson College Multicultural Affairs to conduct 
its 6th Annual Juneteenth event on Saturday, June 18, 2016, from 4:00 p.m. 
to 10:00 p.m., at the Consumers Energy Amphitheater,  One Energy Plaza. 
(Contingent upon receipt of proper insurance coverage.) 
 

F. 3rd Annual How Bazaar: 
Approve a request from Midtown Association to conduct its 3rd Annual 
How Bazaar Jackson Street Festival event on Saturday, July 30, 2016, and 
July 31, 2016, in downtown Jackson on S. Jackson Street between Cortland 
Street and Pearl Street.  Electricity will be used in Bucky Harris Park for 
live entertainment. (Contingent upon receipt of proper insurance 
coverage.) 
 

G. Cascades End of Summer Celebration: 
Approve a request from Jackson County Parks Department to conduct its 
Annual End of Summer Celebration event on Saturday, September 3, 2016, 
from 9:00 a.m. to 11:00 p.m. at Cascades Falls Park. (Contingent upon 
receipt of proper insurance coverage.) 



3 
May 24, 2016 

 
H. Jackson Freedom Run: 

Approve a request from Jackson Freedom Run to conduct its Jackson 
Freedom Run event on Saturday, September 24, 2016, from 5:00 a.m. to 
12:00 p.m., with start and finish on Michigan Avenue by Horace Blackman 
Park. (Contingent upon receipt of proper insurance coverage.) 
 

I. Sabin-Maples Wedding: 
Approve a request from Sarah Sabin to conduct her wedding event on 
October 8, 2016, from 11:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m., at the Consumers Energy 
Amphitheater, One Energy Plaza. (Contingent upon receipt of proper 
insurance coverage.) 
 

J. City Summary of Revenue and Expenditures: 
Receive the City of Jackson’s summary of revenue and expenditures for 
ten (10) months ended, April 30, 2016. 
 

K. CDBG and HOME Financial Statements through April 30, 2016: 
Receive the Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) and HOME 
Financial Summaries through April 30, 2016. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by Councilmember 
Robinson to approve the Consent Calendar. Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  none.  
Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

 
PUBLIC HEARINGS: 

 
Recess as City Council and convene as a Board of Review: 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by Councilmember 
Robinson to adjourn as City Council and convene as Board of Review. Votes – 
Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies 
(6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
  
A. Public Hearing on Special Assessment Roll No. 4263 – Delinquent 

Miscellaneous General Fund Accounts Receivable. 
 
1. Resolution confirming Roll No. 4263. 
 

No public comments were heard. Motion was made by 
Councilmember Greer, seconded by Councilmember Dobies to approve.  
Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, 
Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember 
Frounfelker (1). 
 



4 
May 24, 2016 

 
B. Public Hearing on Special Assessment Roll No. 4264 – Delinquent 

Miscellaneous Building Department Fund Accounts Receivable. 
 
1. Resolution confirming Roll No. 4264. 
 

No public comments were heard.  Motion was made by 
Councilmember Dobies, seconded by Councilmember Greer to approve.  
Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, 
Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember 
Frounfelker (1). 
 

C. Public Hearing on Special Assessment Roll No. 4267 – Delinquent 
Miscellaneous Public Works Fund Accounts Receivable. 

 
1. Resolution confirming Roll No. 4267. 

 
No public comments heard.  Motion was made by Councilmember 

Dobies, seconded by Councilmember Dancy to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  
Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies 
(6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

 
Adjourn as a Board of Review and reconvene as City Council. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies to close the public hearing and reconvene as City 
Council. 

 
OTHER BUSINESS: 

 
A. Ordinance No. 2016-11 – Removal of Refuse in Public Right-of-Way 

(Second/Final Reading). 
Recommendation:  Final adoption of Ordinance No. 2016-11, adding 
Chapter 12, Section 12-9.1, and amending Chapter 12, Section 12-10, City 
Code, to provide for a five (5) day notice period for property owners and 
occupants to remove trash and refuse debris in a public right-of-way on 
their private property. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies for final adoption.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (5).  Nays:  
Councilmember Robinson (1).  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1).     

 
B. Corrective Resolution for 2016 City Council Meeting Dates. 

Recommendation:  Consider a Corrective Resolution that serves as the 
calendar for the regularly scheduled City Council meeting dates for 2016. 



5 
May 24, 2016 

 
Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 

Councilmember Pappin to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

C. 2015 Michigan Avenue Sidewalk Restoration Contract. 
Recommendation:  Approve Change Order 5 to the 2015 Michigan 
Avenue Sidewalk Restoration contract with Dunigan Brothers, Inc., in the 
amount of $235,733.51, and authorize the City Manager and City Engineer 
to execute the appropriate documents. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dancy to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

D. Parking Lot Construction Change Order 6. 
Recommendation:  Approve Change Order 6 to the contract with Bailey 
Excavating, Inc., for Parking Lot Construction in the increased amount of 
$61,612.00 to add items necessary to complete the work in the field and 
authorize the City Manager and City Engineer to execute the appropriate 
document. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dancy to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

NEW BUSINESS: 
 
A. Ordinance – Building Code Board of Examiners and Appeals 

Membership (First Reading). 
Recommendation:  Consider an ordinance amending Chapter 5, Article 2, 
City Code, to reduce the minimum number of members on the Building 
Code Board of Examiners and Appeals (BCBEA) from seven (7) to five (5), 
to change some of the requirements to be a member on the board, and to 
permit the Building Code Board of Examiners and Appeals to act as the 
City’s Construction Board of Appeals. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Pappin to approve and advance to the second reading. 
Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, 
Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember 
Frounfelker (1). 
 



6 
May 24, 2016 

 
B. Resolution – 2016-17 Annual City of Jackson Budget. 

Recommendation:  Approve a resolution adopting the fiscal year 2016-17 
annual budget providing appropriations for various funds (except for the 
CDBG funds which are adopted separately), amending the current fiscal 
year 2015-16 budget to those amounts projected, and ordering a tax levy. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Greer to approve the resolution.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor 
Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  
Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

 
C. DDA 2016-17 Annual Budget. 

Recommendation:   Approve the fiscal year 2016-2017 Budget for the 
Downtown Development Authority pursuant to Act 197 of the Public 
Acts of 1975 as last amended. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

  
D. Resolution to amend the HOME Investment Partnerships budget for 

2012/2013 and 2015/2016. 
Recommendation:  Approve a resolution amending the HOME 
Investment Partnerships budget for fiscal years 2012/2013 and 2015/2016 
allocating unutilized Community Housing Development Organization 
(CHDO) operating expenses for use in 2015/2016 CHDO operating 
expenses. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Pappin to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

E. Resolution – Right of First Refusal. 
Recommendation:  Approve a resolution to exercise the City of Jackson’s 
Right of First Refusal under PA 123 of 1999, to acquire 25 tax foreclosed 
properties for inclusion in the Help for Hardest Hit Blight Elimination 
Program. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Greer to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 



7 
May 24, 2016 

 
F. Resolution – Water and Sewer Rate. 

Recommendation:  Approve the 2016-2017 and 2017-2018 Water and 
Sewer Rate Resolution. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

G. Construction Bid for a Primary Clarifier at the WWTP. 
Recommendation:   Award the contract for construction of a new primary 
clarifier at the Wastewater Treatment Plant to Davis Construction, 
Kentwood, in the amount of $1,893,470.00. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Greer to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

H. M.L. King Community Center 2016 Spring/Summer Programs. 
Recommendation:  Approve the M.L. King Community Center 2016 
Spring and Summer Programs. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Pappin to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

I. Jackson Housing Commission Employee Healthcare. 
Recommendation:  Mayor’s recommendation to approve the Jackson 
Housing Commission’s selection of employee healthcare services as 
recommended by the Executive Director. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Pappin to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

J. Hold Harmless Agreement and Insurance Requirement Policy -
American 1 Credit Union Kids’ Fest. 
Recommendation:  Approve the Hold Harmless Agreement and 
Insurance Requirement Policy as presented, and authorize the Mayor to 
sign the Agreement. 
 



8 
May 24, 2016 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Greer to approve.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

K. Historic District Commission Appeal – 756 W. Michigan Avenue. 
Recommendation:  Consider the appeal of the Jackson Historic District 
Commission decision to deny the requested demolition of the home and 
two garages at 756 W. Michigan Avenue. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Pappin, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies to approve the appeal of the decision by the 
Jackson Historic Commission to deny the requested demolition of the 
home and two garages at 756 W. Michigan Ave.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor 
Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (5).  Nays:  
Councilmember Dancy (1).  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

*L. City Employee Retirement Board Vacancy. 
Recommendation:  Mayor’s recommendation to fill a current vacancy on 
the City Employee Retirement Board beginning immediately and ending 
August 31, 2018. 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by 
Councilmember Dobies to approve the recommendation to appoint Laurie 
Huff to the board filling the current vacancy.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, 
Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin, and Dobies (6).  Nays:  
none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 
 

EXECUTIVE SESSION to discuss pending litigation and a written legal opinion: 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 
Councilmember Greer to suspend Open Session and go into Executive Session.  
Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin and 
Dobies (6). Nays:  none.  Absent:  Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

 
RETURN TO OPEN SESSION: 
 

Motion was made by Councilmember Greer, seconded by Councilmember 
Robinson to return to Open Session.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers 
Robinson, Dancy, Greer, Pappin and Dobies (6). Nays:  none.  Absent:  
Councilmember Frounfelker (1). 

 
Motion was made by Councilmember Dobies, seconded by 

Councilmember Greer to approve the resolution setting forth the rates for 
housing code.  Votes – Yeas:  Mayor Jors, Councilmembers Robinson, Dancy, 



9 
May 24, 2016 

Greer, and Dobies (5).  Nays:  Councilmember Pappin (1).   Absent:  
Councilmember Frounfelker (1).   

 
 

CITY COUNCILMEMBERS’ COMMENTS. 
 
MANAGER’S COMMENTS. 
 
ADJOURNMENT: 
 

No further business being presented, motion was made to adjourn by 
Councilmember Greer, seconded by Councilmember Dobies.  Motion carried.  
Mayor Jors closed the meeting at 8:30 p.m. 

 
 



































































 

 
MEMO TO:   Mayor and City Councilmembers 
 
FROM:  Patrick H. Burtch, City Manager 
 
DATE:  June 14, 2016 
 
SUBJECT: Approval of the Reimbursement Resolution for Street Improvement Projects 
 
 
Recommendation:  
 

Approval of the Reimbursement Resolution for the special assessment portion of Street 
Improvement Projects. 

 
Attached is a memo from Philip Hones, Finance Director, regarding the adoption of a Reimbursement 
Resolution for street construction special assessments included in the FY 2017 adopted budget. 
 
I recommend approval of this Resolution. Your consideration and concurrence is appreciated. 
 
 
 
PHB 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 



DEPARTMENTAL REPORT 
 

 
 

MEMO TO:   Patrick Burtch, City Manager 
 
FROM:   Philip Hones, Finance Director  
 
DATE:   June 14, 2016 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Approval of the Reimbursement Resolution for Street Improvement Projects 
 
 

 

 
The Fiscal Year 2017 Budget recently adopted includes street projects that are intended to be partially 
financed with special assessments totaling $ 1,233,203 (listing is attached). Adopting this Resolution will 
give the City flexibility to “bond” these special assessments following completion of the construction of 
these projects if that is determined to be a more prudent option than financing these assessments internally. 
The maximum amount of debt that can be bonded, per the Resolution, is $ 1.5 million so as to allow for the 
situation in which some of these street projects exceed their budgeted estimates. 
 
 
 

There are no budgetary considerations related to this proposed action. 

 

 

The City last issued Special Assessment Bonds in 1996 and had also issued bonds of this type in 1990 and 
1995. Since that time new special assessments have been financed internally. Currently the City has 
approximately $ 1.53 million in outstanding special assessments that are financed internally. The City uses 
excess funds in the Worker’s Compensation Fund currently to finance these assessments until collected, 
however, the amount of these funds available for financing future special assessments is becoming limited. 
Having this Resolution adopted now will give the City the flexibility to issue bonds to finance these 
assessments should the City’s cash position warrant that option. 

 

 

Should this Resolution be adopted the City will have up to three years to bond the assessments following the 
initial payment on each of the street projects. The City Council will then have to adopt certain resolutions 
related to the bonding process should it be determined that bonding is the preferred option. 

 

 

SUMMARY

BUDGETARY CONSIDERATIONS

HISTORY, BACKGROUND and DISCUSSION 

DISCUSSION OF THE ISSUE



  

M
IL

LE
R

, C
A

N
F

IE
LD

, P
A

D
D

O
C

K
 A

N
D

 S
T

O
N

E
, P

.L
.C

. 

  

 

 

  

 

REIMBURSEMENT RESOLUTION  
FOR STREET IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS 
___________________________________ 

CITY OF JACKSON 
County of Jackson, State of Michigan 

___________________________________ 
 
 

Minutes of a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Jackson, County of Jackson, State 
of Michigan, held on June 14, 2016, at 6:30 p.m., prevailing Eastern Time. 

PRESENT: Members ___________________________________________________________ 

 ________________________________________________________________________ 

ABSENT: Members ___________________________________________________________ 

The following preamble and resolution were offered by Member: ___________________ and 
supported by Member: _________________________: 

WHEREAS, the City of Jackson, County of Jackson, State of Michigan (the “City”), intends to 
issue general obligation limited tax bonds in the principal amount of not to exceed One Million Five 
Hundred Thousand Dollars ($1,500,000) (the “Bonds”), for the purpose of paying all or part of the cost 
of acquiring and constructing major and local street improvements in the City (the “Project”); and 

WHEREAS, the City intends at this time to state its intentions to be reimbursed from proceeds of 
the Bonds for any expenditures undertaken by the City for the Project prior to issuance of the Bonds. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT: 

1. The City makes the following declarations for the purpose of complying with the 
reimbursement rules of Treas. Reg. § 1.150-2 pursuant to the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as amended: 

(a) The City reasonably expects to reimburse itself with proceeds of the Bonds 
for certain costs of the Project which were paid or will be paid from funds 
of the City subsequent to sixty (60) days prior to today.  

(b) The maximum principal amount of debt expected to be issued for the 
Project, including issuance costs, is $1,500,000. 

(c) A reimbursement allocation of the capital expenditures described above 
with the proceeds of the Bonds will occur not later than 18 months after the 
later of (i) the date on which the expenditure is paid, or (ii) the date the 
Project is placed in service or abandoned, but in no event more than three 
(3) years after the original expenditure is paid.  A reimbursement allocation 
is an allocation in writing that evidences the City’s use of the proceeds of 
the Bonds to reimburse the City for a capital expenditure made pursuant to 
this resolution. 



  

M
IL

LE
R

, C
A

N
F

IE
LD

, P
A

D
D

O
C

K
 A

N
D

 S
T

O
N

E
, P

.L
.C

. 

  

 

 

 
-2- 

 

 

2. All resolutions and parts of resolutions insofar as they conflict with the provisions of this 
resolution be and the same hereby are rescinded. 

AYES:  Members:__________________________________________________________ 

_______________________________________________________________________ 

NAYS: Members:__________________________________________________________ 

RESOLUTION DECLARED ADOPTED. 
 
 
 

__________________________________________ 
City Clerk  

 
 
I hereby certify that the attached is a true and complete copy of a resolution adopted by the City 

Council of the City of Jackson, County of Jackson, State of Michigan, at a regular meeting held on June 
14, 2016, and that public notice of said meeting was given pursuant to and in full compliance with Act 
No. 267, Public Acts of Michigan, 1976 and that minutes of the meeting were kept and will be or have 
been made available as required by said Act. 
 
 

__________________________________________ 
City Clerk  

 
 

 
26855258.1\043520-00056  



City of Jackson

List of Special Assessment Projects in FY 2017 Budget 

Major Street

Francis: Washington to Glick 47,043       

Mechanic: Washington to Pearl 165,046    

I94‐BL(Michigan): Brown to Steward (MDOT) 89,077       

Kibby: City Limits to West Ave 74,960       

M50 (West Ave):MI‐Wildwood,Ganson‐North (MDOT) 45,343       

Mechanic: Morrell to Washington 140,363    

Wisner: Argyle to Boardman (Cat F) 368,209    

930,041    

Local Street

Edward & Winthrop: Wildwood to JHS 60,897       

Jackson: Washington to Glick. 242,265    

303,162    

Total Budgeted 1,233,203 



 

 

 
 

MEMO TO:   Mayor and City Councilmembers 
 
FROM:  Patrick H. Burtch, City Manager 
 
DATE:  June 14, 2016 
 
SUBJECT:  Resolution for Approval of Contract with MDOT for Mechanic Street 
 
 
Recommendation:  
 

Approval of a resolution to enter into a contract with the Michigan Department of 
Transportation (MDOT) for street reconstruction on Mechanic Street from Morrell Street 
to Washington Avenue, and authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk/Treasurer to 
execute the appropriate documents. 
 

 
Attached is a memo from Jon H. Dowling, City Engineer, regarding a contract for Mechanic Street 
reconstruction. 
 
I recommend approval of the recommendation. Your consideration and concurrence is appreciated. 
 
PHB 
 
Attachments 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



T:\2016 projects\Mechanic - Morrell to Washington\2_DESIGN & PRECON\Request to Approve MDOT Mechanic Contract Council report.docx 

DEPARTMENTAL REPORT 
 

 
MEMO TO:   Patrick Burtch, City Manager 
 
FROM:   Jon H. Dowling, P.E. 
 
DATE:   June 14, 2016 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Approval of a resolution to enter into a contract with the Michigan 
Department of Transportation (MDOT) for street reconstruction on Mechanic Street from Morrell 
Street to Washington Avenue, and authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk/Treasurer to execute 
the appropriate documents. 
 

 
Attached is a resolution to enter into a contract with the Michigan Department of Transportation for street reconstruction 
on Mechanic Street from Morrell Street to Washington Avenue. 
 
 
 
The project is broken down into two parts: Part A–roadway reconstruction and Part B–water main replacement and 
sanitary sewer replacement.  The City has received federal funding for 81.85% for Part A to a maximum of $748,750. 
 
The cost-participation agreement and contract for this project has been prepared by the Michigan Department of 
Transportation and forwarded to the City of Jackson for approval.  The estimate for the construction work is $1,570,600 
with the federal share being $748,750 and the City share being $821,850. 
 
 
 
Engineering records do not show the exact year that the pavement on Mechanic Street was originally constructed. 
However, a map dated 1919 shows that Mechanic Street was paved at that time. The original brick street is still in place 
in some blocks and serves as a base for the existing street. Engineering records do show that the segment between Biddle 
and Mason received full-depth pavement reconstruction in 1966. The surface over the entire length between Morrell 
and Washington was then milled and repaved with a single course of asphalt in 1979. The current condition of the 
pavement is poor. It has cracking, potholes and extensive pathing throughout. Sections of the existing curb and gutter 
are overlaid and/or broken.   
 
 
 

Engineering proposes concrete curb and gutter replacement and full depth pavement replacement with new aggregate 
base and asphalt pavement throughout the project area. The antiquated cast iron water mains (constructed in or prior to 
1919) and those sections of brick and vitrified clay sanitary sewer (constructed in 1907) within the project area will be 
replaced in conjunction with street construction. The water main portion of this project is part of the water main 
replacement program to improve water quality and pressure in the neighborhood. The sanitary sewer portion of this 
project is a continuation of the work Engineering has been doing for many years towards the elimination of brick sewers 
from the sanitary system as they are difficult to maintain once the mortar begins to deteriorate. 
 
 
 
I am requesting the attached resolution to enter into the contract with the Michigan Department of Transportation be 
approved by the City Council, and the Mayor and City Treasurer/Clerk be authorized to sign the appropriate contract 
documents. 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 
Attachments 

SUMMARY

BUDGETARY CONSIDERATIONS

HISTORY, BACKGROUND and DISCUSSION 

DISCUSSION OF THE ISSUE

POSITIONS



RESOLUTION 
 
BY CITY COUNCIL: 
 
 WHEREAS, Mechanic Street between Morrell Street and Washington Avenue is in need 
of improvements; and  
 
 WHEREAS, the project is broken down into two parts: Part A–roadway reconstruction and 
Part B–water main replacement and sanitary sewer replacement; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the project has received federal funding for 81.85%, to a maximum of 
$748,750 for Part A of this project; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the cost-participation agreement and contract for this project has been 
prepared by the Michigan Department of Transportation and forwarded to the City of Jackson for 
approval; and 
 

WHEREAS, the estimate for the construction work is $1,570,600 with the federal share 
being $748,750 and the City share being $821,850. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council does approve the 
construction on Mechanic Street between Morrell Street and Washington Avenue; and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council does approve entering into the 
contract with the Michigan Department of Transportation for the reconstruction of Mechanic 
Street; and 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council does authorize the Mayor and the 
City Treasurer/Clerk to sign the contract documents on behalf of the City. 
 

* * * * 
 
State of Michigan ) 
County of Jackson )ss 
City of Jackson ) 
 
I, Andrew J. Wrozek, Jr., City Treasurer/Clerk in and for the City of Jackson, County and State 
aforesaid, do hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and complete copy of a resolution adopted 
by the Jackson City Council on the 14th day of June, 2016. 
 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereto 
affixed my signature and the Seal of the City 
of Jackson, Michigan, on this 15th day of 
June, 2016. 
 

___________________________________  ____________________________________ 
William C. Jors, Mayor    Andrew J. Wrozek, Jr., City Treasurer/Clerk 































































 
 

DEPARTMENTAL REPORT 
 
MEMO TO: Honorable Mayor and City Councilmembers 
 
FROM: Patrick H. Burtch, City Manager  

 Bethany M. Smith, City Attorney  
 Courtney A. Gabbara, Staff Attorney 
 Matthew Heins, Chief of Police 
 David Wooden, Deputy Fire Chief   
 
DATE:  Council Meeting – June 14, 2016 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  Approve Ordinance Revisions to Chapter 10, Fire Prevention and Protection, by 
Incorporating Language from the 2015 International Fire Code   
 

 

 
 
The recommended action is approval of several Revisions to Chapter 10 of the City of Jackson Code of 
Ordinances by incorporating language from the International Code Council’s 2015 International Fire Code. 
This action is being recommended in order to allow the Jackson Fire Division (“Division”) to better protect 
the health, safety, and welfare of the citizens of the City by regulating and governing hazardous or 
potentially hazardous conditions.     
 

 
 
There are no foreseen budgetary considerations or concerns.  
 

 
 
The International Code Council updates its International Fire Code every three (3) years. By adopting the 
2015 International Fire Code into our Code of Ordinances, we will ensure that the Division is staying 
abreast of modern, up-to-date fire code that address conditions considered hazardous to life and property 
from fire, explosion, and handling or use of hazardous materials. Currently, the Chapter adopts by reference 
the BOCA National Fire Prevention Code of 1996.  
  



 
 
The Division has been considering updating Chapter 10 of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances for some 
time. It is a necessary step to ensure the public receives proper protection from various health, safety, and 
welfare hazards. Based on the need to update Chapter 10 of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances, the 
City Attorney’s Office and the Jackson Fire Division would request that the Council approve the Revisions. 
Attached, please find copies of Sections 1-18 and 28-31 of the Code of Ordinances, which are referenced 
throughout Chapter 10. 
 

 
 
The City Attorney’s Office and the Jackson Fire Division recommend approval of the Revisions, which 
would incorporate the International Code Council’s 2015 International Fire Code into Chapter 10 of the 
City of Jackson Code of Ordinances.  
 
 
ATTACHMENTS: Fire Prevention and Protection Ordinance (clean) 
 Fire Prevention and Protection Ordinance (track changes) 
 Jackson City Code of Ordinances: Sections 1-18 and 28-31 
 Amended Sections of the 2015 International Fire Code (track changes) 



1 
 

ORDINANCE 2016 - ____ 

An Ordinance amending Chapter 10 of the Code of Ordinances of 
the City of Jackson, Michigan to adopt language from the 
International Code Council’s 2015 International Fire Code for the 
health, safety and welfare of the Citizens of the City of Jackson. 

 
THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON ORDAIN: 

Section 1. Purpose. 

The City Council adopts this ordinance to incorporate language from the International Code 
Council’s 2015 International Fire Code for the health, safety and welfare of the Citizens of the 
City of Jackson.  
 
Section 2.  
 
That Chapter 10 of the City of Jackson, Michigan Code of Ordinances, be amended to read as 
follows: 
 
ARTICLE I. - IN GENERAL 

Secs. 10-1—10-25. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE II. - FIRE Division 
 
Sec. 10-26. - Purpose.  

 The purpose of the fire prevention code of the city is to protect the health, safety 
and welfare of the people living and working in the city by regulating and governing conditions 
hazardous or potentially hazardous to life and property from fire and/or explosion or both. 

Sec. 10-27. - Director of Police and Fire Services. 

 The fire division shall be headed by the director of police and fire services or his designee 
(“director”) and shall be charged with the prevention and extinguishment of fires, the protection 
of life and property against fire, the removal of fire hazards, the performance of other public 
services of an emergency nature assigned to it, and the conducting of an educational fire 
prevention program. 

Sec. 10-28. - Fire prevention duties. 

The fire division shall be responsible for inspecting potential fire hazards, and abatement 
of existing fire hazards, in accordance with the provisions of this chapter. 



2 
 

Sec. 10-29. - Division rules. 

 The director of police and fire services shall adopt rules and regulations for the 
government of the fire division, subject to the approval of the city manager, and may change and 
repeal the same upon notice to and approval by the city manager. Such rules and regulations 
shall designate the chain of command for the fire division, so that in the absence or disability of 
the director or any officer of the fire division, the responsibility for the operation of the division 
shall immediately and automatically be vested in the next ranking officer or member of the 
division on duty at the time of a fire. 

Sec. 10-30. - Division equipment. 

 The director shall be responsible for the maintenance and care of all property and 
equipment used by the fire department. 

Secs. 10-31—10-51. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE III. - FIRE PREVENTION CODE 

Sec. 10-52. - Adoption by reference. 

 There is hereby adopted by reference as the fire prevention code of the City the 
International Code Council (“ICC”), 2015 International Fire Code, with all appendices, 
references and supplements therein printed, with the exception of appendices A, J, and M. The 
ICC, 2015 International Fire Code, which may be amended from time to time, is hereby adopted 
by reference as the Fire Prevention Code of the City of Jackson, excluding amendments, 
deletions, and additions contained within section 10-53. 

Sec. 10-53. - Amendments, deletions and additions. 

The following sections and subsections of the ICC, 2015 International Fire Code, are 
hereby amended or deleted as set forth, and additional sections and subsections are added as 
indicated. Subsequent section numbers used in this section shall refer to the like-numbered 
sections of such fire prevention code. 

Sec. 101.1.  The following portions of Section 101.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Prevention Code of the City of 
Jackson, hereinafter referred to as “this Code”. 

Sec.108.1.  The following portions of Section 108.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Application for appeal. Whenever the director shall disapprove of an application 
or refuse to grant a permit hereunder, or when it is claimed the provisions of this code do 



3 
 

not apply or the true intent of the code has been misinterpreted, the applicant may appeal 
in writing to the City of Jackson Building Code Board of Examiners and Appeals (the 
“Board”) within thirty (30) days from the date of the disapproval of the application or 
refusal to grant a permit. 

Section 108.3 is deleted in its entirety.  

Sec. 109.3.   Notice of Violation. The following portions of Section 109.3 are amended to 
provide as follows: 

Violation Penalties. Person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail 
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or 
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of 
a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $500.00 or by imprisonment not 
exceeding 90 days, or both such fine or imprisonment. Each day that a violation 
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

Sec. 113.1. Fees.  The following portions of Section 113.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Fees. A permit shall not be issued until the fees have been paid, nor shall an 
amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid. Fees 
shall be set by Resolution of the City Council. 

Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, 312, 313, and 314. Outdoor burning. The following portions 
of Section 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, 312, 313, and 314 are amended to provide as follows: 

 

307.1   This section applies to all outdoor burning and open burning within the City of 
Jackson. 

 

307.2  Definitions. 

 
307.2.1  Clean wood means seasoned, dry, and natural wood which has not been 
painted, varnished or coated with a similar material, has not been pressure treated with 
preservatives, and does not contain resins or glues as in plywood or other composite 
wood products. 

 

307.2.2   Construction and demolition waste means building waste materials, including 
but not limited to waste shingles, insulation, lumber, treated wood, painted wood, 
wiring, plastics, packaging, and rubble that results from construction, remodeling, 
repair, and demolition operations on a house, commercial or industrial building, or 
other structure. 

 



4 
 

307.2.3   Manufactured gas fire device means a manufactured gas burning device used 
for outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

307.2.4  Open burning means kindling or maintaining a fire where the products of 
combustion are emitted into the ambient air without passing through a stack or a 
chimney. 

 

307.2.5  Outdoor burning means open burning, burning in a wood-burning unit, or 
burning in a manufactured gas fire device. 

 

307.2.6  Wood-burning unit means a manufactured wood burning device (including a 
chiminea) used for outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

307.3  General prohibition on outdoor burning. Outdoor burning is prohibited unless 
specifically permitted by this section. 

 

307.4  Outdoor burning of refuse, brush, leaves, waste, and grass clippings prohibited. 
Outdoor burning of refuse is prohibited including the burning of brush, leaves, waste, and 
grass clippings. 

 

307.5   A wood-burning unit may be used in the City of Jackson only if it is used in 
accordance with all of the following provisions: 

 

307.5.1  The wood-burning unit shall only be used to burn clean wood. The wood-
burning unit shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, grass clippings, or 
any material or substance other than clean wood. 

 
307.5.2 The wood-burning unit shall be located in the rear yard only. For the purpose 
of this section only, on corner lots, the rear yard shall be considered the yard opposite 
the street on which the front door of the house faces. 

 

307.5.3 The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than twenty-five (25) feet 
from any structure. The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than fifteen (15) 
feet from any neighboring property line. 
 

307.5.4.  The wood-burning unit or burning materials within the unit shall not cause a 
nuisance to neighbors. Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be 
deemed a nuisance and is prohibited. 
 



5 
 

307.5.5 Operational hours for any wood-burning unit shall be limited to the time 
between 9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m.  
 

307.5.6 All fires shall be diligently supervised by at least one person who is eighteen 
(18) years of age or older.  
 

307.5.7 There shall be a minimum of a garden hose connected to a reliable water 
supply, a bucket filled with no less than two (2) gallons of clean water, or a properly 
functioning portable fire extinguisher, rated 2-A; 10-B, C, in plain view and within 
fifteen (15) feet from any wood-burning unit. 
 

307.5.8 The wood-burning unit shall be no wider than three (3) feet in diameter and 
no higher than three (3) feet above the base of the wood-burning unit, which makes 
direct contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit. A 
chiminea shall be no higher than five (5) feet above the base, which makes direct 
contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the chiminea. 
 

307.5.9 The wood-burning unit shall be enclosed on all sides and the bottom, and 
shall have a metallic screen or cover that completely covers the top of the wood-
burning unit. The metallic screen or cover covering the top of the wood-burning unit 
shall be no larger than one-third-inch metallic meshing. Burning materials shall be 
completely contained within the wood-burning unit. The wood-burning unit shall only 
be constructed of metal, concrete, clay, or other similar non-combustible materials. 

 

307.5.10 The materials being burned in the wood-burning unit shall not make direct 
contact with the ground. The base of the wood-burning unit, which makes direct 
contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit, shall not 
make direct contact with the ground. 
 

307.5.11 The wood-burning unit shall only be used with the express permission of the 
property owner or tenant. 
 

307.5.12 The wood-burning unit shall only be used at a one-family or two-family 
dwelling. 
 

307.5.13 Any user of a wood-burning unit shall comply with the directions, 
instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the wood-burning unit. If 
the directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer conflict with 
any provision in this section, the provision in this section shall control. 
 

307.5.14 There shall only be one (1) active wood-burning unit at a property at a time. 

 



6 
 

308.1  A manufactured gas fire device may be used in the City of Jackson at one or two-family 
dwellings and non-residential property only if it is used in accordance with all of the following 
provisions: 

 

308.1.1 The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used to burn flammable gas. 
The manufactured gas fire device shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, 
grass clippings, wood, or any material or substance other than flammable gas. 
 
308.1.2 At one or two family dwellings, the manufactured gas fire device shall be 
located in the rear yard only. For the purpose of this section, on corner lots, the rear 
yard shall be considered the yard opposite the street on which the front door of the 
house faces. 
 

308.1.3 The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than five (5) 
feet from any portion of a structure in any direction, including above the manufactured 
gas fire device. The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than fifteen 
(15) feet from any neighboring property line. The manufactured gas fire device shall be 
located no closer than ten (10) feet from any other manufactured gas fire device, wood-
burning unit, or outdoor burning. 
 

308.1.4 The manufactured gas fire device shall not cause a nuisance to neighbors. 
Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be deemed a nuisance and is 
prohibited. 
 

308.1.5 At one or two family dwellings, operation of a manufactured gas fire device 
shall be limited to the time between 9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m. 
 

308.1.6 All manufactured gas fire devices shall be diligently supervised by at least 
one person who is eighteen (18) years of age or older when the gas fire device is in 
use. 
 

308.1.7 The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used with the express 
permission of the property owner or tenant. 
 

308.1.8 Any user of a manufactured gas fire device shall comply with the 
directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the 
manufactured gas fire device. If the directions, instructions, and warnings provided by 
the manufacturer conflict with any provision in this section, the provision in this 
section shall control. 
 

308.1.9 At a non-residential property, the owner of a manufactured gas fire device 
that will be placed in a public right-of-way shall complete an application for revocable 



7 
 

license and pay the required fee to the Clerk's office. The application must also include 
a general liability insurance certificate verifying that the owner of the manufactured 
gas fire device is insured against personal injury and property damage arising out of 
the use or possession of the manufactured gas fire device. The owner shall also provide 
to the City of Jackson an insurance endorsement stating that the City of Jackson is an 
additional insured, and it must be in a reasonable coverage amount established by the 
City Attorney to ensure the City's protection. Upon receipt of a completed application 
for a revocable license, the application shall be placed on the next regularly scheduled 
City Council meeting for City Council action. All complete applications for a 
revocable license must either be denied or approved and executed within sixty (60) 
days of receipt. If the application for the revocable license is approved by the City 
Council, the Mayor and Clerk shall execute the revocable license. Any complete 
application that is not denied within sixty (60) days of receipt shall be deemed 
approved. 
 
308.1.10 At non-residential property, a manufactured gas fire device shall only be in 
use during the hours that the business is open. 

 

309.1  Exceptions. Subsections 307.3, 307.5, and 308.1 do not apply to: 

 

309.1.1  Grilling or cooking food using charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in 
cooking appliances, braziers, hibachis, grills, outdoor fireplaces or gas-fired stoves. 

 
309.1.2  The temporary use of propane, acetylene, natural gas, gasoline or kerosene 
in a device intended for construction or maintenance activities. 
 

309.1.3 The temporary use of non-ash producing fuels being used not less than 
fifteen (15) feet from combustible materials, when used in metal containers for the 
heating of building materials or for the warmth of workers. 
 

309.1.4 Outdoor burning by the City Fire Division in connection with training and 
performance of its duties. 

 

310.1  The department of police and fire services is authorized to enforce this section. 

 

311.1  A City official or employee enforcing this section may require the owner, tenant, 
occupant, guest, or any other person at the property to extinguish any outdoor fire that creates 
a fire hazard, is a nuisance, is reasonably objectionable, or is unsafe. If there are no capable, 
available, or willing people at the property to extinguish an outdoor fire, the City official or 
employee may extinguish the outdoor fire. 
 



8 
 

312.1  Charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in cooking appliances, braziers, hibachis, 
grills, stoves, or other similar devices when in use outdoors for cooking or heating purposes, 
shall not be used or kindled on any balcony, shall not be used or kindled under any 
overhanging portion of a structure, and shall be located no closer than ten (10) feet from any 
portion of a structure in any direction, including above, at property that has a structure or 
structures that contain more than two dwelling units. 

 

313.1  Any provision or requirement in Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, and 312 may be 
waived or modified only with the express written permission of the City Fire Division or 
approval by the City Council. 

 

314.1  Between the passage date of this ordinance and the effective date of this ordinance, any 
provision or requirement in Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, and 312 may be waived or 
modified only with the express written permission of the City Fire Division or approval by the 
City Council. 
 

Sec. 506.1. Key boxes; installation; contents. The following portions of Section 506.1 are 
amended to provide as follows: 

Key boxes; installation; contents. A key box of a type approved by the fire 
official shall be required when a property is protected by an automatic fire alarm system 
or access to the property is made unusually difficult because of secured doors or other 
openings. Such key box, when installed, shall contain all of the following: 

1. Keys to locked points of ingress whether on the interior or exterior of such 
buildings. 
 

2. Keys to locked mechanical equipment rooms. 
 

3. Keys to locked electrical rooms. 
 

4. Keys to elevator controls. 
 

5. Keys to other areas as deemed necessary by the fire official. 
 

Sec. 560.4. Explosive materials storage and handling. The following portions of Section 560.4 
are amended to provide as follows:   

5604.1 General. Storage of explosives and explosive materials, small arms 
ammunition, small arms primers, propellant-actuated cartridges and smokeless 
propellants in magazines shall comply with the provisions of this section. The storage of 
explosives and blasting agents is prohibited within all zoning designations of property 



9 
 

within the city except those areas designated as I-1 or I-2 industrial properties and C-1, 
C-2, C-3, or C-4, commercial districts by the zoning code of the City of Jackson; 
provided, however, that temporary storage not to exceed five (5) continuous days in 
conjunction with approved blasting operations shall be permissible. 

 It shall not be deemed unlawful under this section to store wholesale and retail 
stocks of small arms ammunition, explosive bolts, explosive rivets, or cartridges for 
explosive-activated power tools in quantities involving less than five hundred (500) 
pounds of explosive material. 

Sec. 10-54. - Districts in which storage of flammable liquids and explosives prohibited. 

The limits referred to in the fire prevention code adopted by this article which restrict or 
prohibit the storage of explosives and blasting agents, Sec. 5601; flammable liquids, Sec. 5701; 
and storage of liquefied petroleum gas, Sec. 6101et seq., are hereby established for all zoning 
districts created by section 28-31 of the city code except "I" industrial districts. 

Sec. 10-55. - Appeals. 

Whenever the director of police and fire services shall disapprove an application or refuse 
to grant a permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the code adopted by this 
article do not apply or that the true intent and meaning of such code have been misconstrued or 
wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal from the decision of the director to the Board 
within thirty (30) days from the date of the decision appealed. 

Secs. 10-56—10-69. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE IV. - HAZARDOUS MATERIAL (HAZMAT) UNIT 

Sec. 10-70. - Definitions. 

For purposes of this article, the following definitions shall apply: 

Emergency hazardous material incident means a spill, leakage, release, or other 
dissemination or threat of same of any hazardous materials requiring immediate action to 
mitigate a threat to public health, safety or welfare. 

Expenses shall include but not be limited to the actual labor costs to the city and its 
personnel including Workers' Compensation benefits, fringe benefits, administrative overhead, 
costs of equipment, costs of equipment operation, costs and materials, costs of disposal, costs of 
any contract labor and materials, and those costs associated with an emergency hazardous 



10 
 

materials incident, in order to ensure the safety of the city and its populace. Expenses shall also 
include the charges or costs incurred by the city as a result of a HazMat unit response to an 
emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Hazardous materials shall include but not necessarily be limited to, all materials 
identified in E102, and materials designated as hazardous by the State of Michigan in Public Act 
307 of 1982, as amended, or by the Federal Superfund Amendment and Reauthorization Act 
(SARA), as amended. 

HazMat unit means the vehicle provided by the city, individually or pursuant to an 
agreement with another municipality, equipped with apparatus designed to provide emergency 
service in situations involving a spill, leak, accident or other similar occurrence involving 
hazardous materials. 

Owner means any individual, firm, company, association, society, corporation, 
partnership, or group, including their officers and employees, who are either listed as the owner 
of record by the Jackson County Register of Deeds, have a land contract vendee interest in, or 
are listed as the taxpayer of record for the real property where the emergency hazardous material 
incident occurred, or have title, use, possession or control of the hazardous material or the 
vehicle used to transport same. 

Person means any individual, firm, company, association, society, corporation, 
partnership, or group, including their officers and employees, who has responsibility for or actual 
involvement in the emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Sec. 10-71. - Hazardous materials incident emergency. 

In the event a spill, leakage, release, or other dissemination of any hazardous material has 
occurred, the city fire chief, or his/her authorized representative, shall determine whether such 
occurrence constitutes an emergency hazardous materials incident, and if so determined, the city 
may take immediate steps to abate and control the hazardous materials. 

Sec. 10-72. - Expenses of an emergency hazardous materials incident. 

In the event of an emergency hazardous materials incident, all owners or persons who 
have responsibility for or involvement in the emergency hazardous materials incident shall be 
jointly and severally liable to the city for any expenses incurred in responding to said emergency 
hazardous materials incident. In the event said owner or person fails to pay said expenses within 
sixty (60) days after the city mails its invoice of expenses to said owner or person, the city may 
take such collection efforts to recover said expenses that it deems appropriate, including, but not 
limited to, causing such expenses to be levied and assessed as a special assessment upon the real 
property where the hazardous materials emergency occurred, and collecting the same in the same 



11 
 

manner as provided in the City Charter; provided, however, such unpaid expenses may not be 
levied as a special assessment against any real property unless the owner, or person in charge of 
or responsible for said real property, has a connection or involvement with the hazardous 
material that resulted in an emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Sec. 10-73. - Payment of invoice. 

Payment of an invoice for expenses incurred by the city under this article shall not 
constitute an admission of guilt or responsibility under any other ordinance, law, rule, or 
regulation. 

Sec. 10-74. - Repeal of conflicting ordinances.  

All ordinances or parts or ordinances conflicting with the provisions of this article are 
hereby repealed, only to the extent necessary to give this article full force and effect. 

Sec. 10-75. - Invalidity provision. 

Should the courts declare any provision or section of this article unconstitutional or 
invalid, then such decision shall affect only the section or provision so passed upon, and shall not 
affect any other section or part of this article. 

Sec. 10-76. - Construction. 

The general penalty provision of section 1-18 of this code shall not apply to this article. 

 
 

Section 3. Effective date. 

This ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days from the date of adoption.  



1 
 

ORDINANCE 2016 - ____ 

An Ordinance amending Chapter 10 of the Code of Ordinances of 
the City of Jackson, Michigan to adopt language from the 
International Code Council’s 2015 International Fire Code for the 
health, safety and welfare of the Citizens of the City of Jackson. 

 
THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON ORDAIN: 

Section 1. Purpose. 

The City Council adopts this ordinance to incorporate language from the International Code 
Council’s 2015 International Fire Code for the health, safety and welfare of the Citizens of the 
City of Jackson.  
 
Section 2.  
 
That Chapter 10 of the City of Jackson, Michigan Code of Ordinances, be amended to read as 
follows: 
 
ARTICLE I. - IN GENERAL 

Secs. 10-1—10-25. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE II. - FIRE DEPARTMENT Division 
 
Sec. 10-5226. - Purpose. 

  

 The purpose of the fire prevention code of the city is to protect the health, safety and 
welfare of the people living and working in the city by regulating and governing conditions 
hazardous or potentially hazardous to life and property from fire and/or explosion or both. 

 

Sec. 10-2627. - Deputy fire chief.Director of Police and Fire Services. 

 The fire division shall be headed by the deputy fire chiefdirector of police and fire 
services or his designee (“director”) and shall be charged with the prevention and extinguishment 
of fires, the protection of life and property against fire, the removal of fire hazards, the 
performance of other public services of an emergency nature assigned to it, and the conducting 
of an educational fire prevention program. 

Sec. 10-2728. - Fire prevention duties. 



2 
 

The fire department division shall be responsible for inspecting potential fire hazards, and 
abatement of existing fire hazards, in accordance with the provisions of this chapter. 

Sec. 10-2829. - Departmental Division rules. 

 The director of police and fire services shall adopt rules and regulations for the 
government of the fire division, subject to the approval of the city manager, and may change and 
repeal the same upon notice to and approval by the city manager. Such rules and regulations 
shall designate the chain of command for the fire division, so that in the absence or disability of 
the deputy fire chiefdirector or any officer of the fire division, the responsibility for the operation 
of the division shall immediately and automatically be vested in the next ranking officer or 
member of the division on duty at the time of a fire. 

Sec. 10-2930. - Department Division equipment. 

 The directorfire chief shall be responsible for the maintenance and care of all property 
and equipment used by the fire department. 

Secs. 10-3031—10-5051. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE III. - FIRE PREVENTION CODE 

Sec. 10-5152. - Adoption by reference. 

 There is hereby adopted by reference as the fire prevention code of the city City the 
International Code Council (“ICC”), 2015 International Fire Code, with all appendices, 
references and supplements therein printed, with the exception of appendices A, J, and M.. The 
ICC, 2015 International Fire Code, which may be amended from time to time, is hereby adopted 
by reference as the Fire Prevention Code of the City of Jackson, excluding amendments, 
deletions, and additions contained within section 10-53..BOCA National Fire Prevention Code of 
1996, with all appendices, references and supplements therein printed. 

Sec. 10-52. - Purpose. 

The purpose of the fire prevention code of the city is to protect the health, safety and welfare of 
the people living and working in the city by regulating and governing conditions hazardous or 
potentially hazardous to life and property from fire and/or explosion or both. 

Sec. 10-53. - Amendments, deletions and additions. 

The following sections and subsections of the National Fire Prevention Code, 1996 edition, are 
hereby amended or deleted as set forth, and additional sections and subsections are added as 



3 
 

indicated. Subsequent section numbers used in this section shall refer to the like-numbered 
sections of such fire prevention code. 

Sec. F-101.Q. General. Section F-101.1 is amended to read as follows: 

  F-101.1. Title. These regulations as set forth herein shall be known as the Fire 
Prevention Code of the City of Jackson. 

Sec. F-107.0. Permits. Section F-107.2.3 is added to read as follows: 

  F-107.2.3. Exemption from fee schedule. Notwithstanding any language contained 
within subsection F-107.8 to the contrary, the annual fire safety inspection of each and 
every place of public assembly which is operated by a commonly recognized religious 
entity as a regular place of worship shall be done without fee, and a public assembly permit 
shall not be required. 

Sec. F-107.8 is amended to read as follows: 

F-207.8. Fees. A permit shall not be issued until a fee has been paid to the city in 
accordance with the following schedule: 

Sec. F-112.3. Penalty for violations. Section F-112.3 is amended to read as follows: 

  F-112.3. Penalty for violations. Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the 
provisions of this code, or failing to comply with any order issued pursuant to this code, 
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall, upon conviction, be punished in accordance 
with section 1-18 of the Code of the City of Jackson. 

Sec. F-113.0. Means of appeal. Section F-113.1 is amended to read as follows: 

  F-113.1. Application for appeal. Whenever the chief of the fire department shall 
disapprove of an application or refuse to grant a permit hereunder, or when it is claimed the 
provisions of the code do not apply or the true intent of the code has been misconstrued or 
wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal in writing from the decision of the fire chief 
to the building board within thirty (30) days from the date it was ordered. 

The remainder of section F-113.0 is deleted in its entirety. 

Sec. F-202.0. The following portions of section F-202.0 are amended or deleted as follows: 

  Building code official: The assistant chief fire marshal of the City of Jackson and 
his/her designees. 

  Code official: The assistant chief fire marshal of the City of Jackson and his/her 
designees. 



4 
 

  Open burning: Deleted. 

Sec. F-309.0. Commercial kitchen exhaust suppression systems. Section F-309.2 is amended 
to read as follows: 

  F-309.2. Periodic inspection. An approved inspection shall be performed a 
minimum of once every six (6) months on each commercial kitchen exhaust suppression 
system. Inspections shall be made only by the manufacturer, ins taller or maintenance 
company. The inspection shall ascertain that the system will cover all the cooking surfaces 
with the extinguishing agent when manually or automatically actuated. The manual 
actuation, automatic actuation, and system interconnections shall also be inspected to 
determine that they operate as required. A written inspection report shall be filed with the 
code official upon completion of each inspection. 

Sec. F-403.0. Outdoor and Open burning. Section F-403.0 is amended to read as follows: 

(a) This section applies to all outdoor burning and open burning within the City of Jackson. 

 

(b) Definitions. 

 

(1) Clean wood means seasoned, dry, and natural wood which has not been painted, 
varnished or coated with a similar material, has not been pressure treated with 
preservatives, and does not contain resins or glues as in plywood or other composite 
wood products. 
 

(2) Construction and demolition waste means building waste materials, including but 
not limited to waste shingles, insulation, lumber, treated wood, painted wood, 
wiring, plastics, packaging, and rubble that results from construction, remodeling, 
repair, and demolition operations on a house, commercial or industrial building, or 
other structure. 

 

(3) Manufactured gas fire device means a manufactured gas burning device used for 
outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

(3) Open burning means kindling or maintaining a fire where the products of 
combustion are emitted into the ambient air without passing through a stack or a 
chimney. 
 

(5)Outdoor burning means open burning, burning in a wood-burning unit, or burning in 
a manufactured gas fire device. 

 



5 
 

(6) Wood-burning unit means a manufactured wood burning device (including a 
chiminea) used for outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

(c) General prohibition on outdoor burning. Outdoor burning is prohibited unless specifically 
permitted by this section. 

 

(d) Outdoor burning of refuse, brush, leaves, waste, and grass clippings prohibited. Outdoor 
burning of refuse is prohibited including the burning of brush, leaves, waste, and grass 
clippings. 

 

(e) A wood-burning unit may be used in the City of Jackson only if it is used in accordance 
with all of the following provisions: 

 

(1) The wood-burning unit shall only be used to burn clean wood. The wood-burning 
unit shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, grass clippings, or any 
material or substance other than clean wood. 

 
(2) The wood-burning unit shall be located in the rear yard only. For the purpose of 

this section only, on corner lots, the rear yard shall be considered the yard 
opposite the street on which the front door of the house faces. 

 

(3) The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than twenty-five (25) feet from 
any structure. The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than fifteen (15) 
feet from any neighboring property line. 

 

(4)  The wood-burning unit or burning materials within the unit shall not cause a 
nuisance to neighbors. Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be 
deemed a nuisance and is prohibited. 

 

(5) Operational hours for any wood-burning unit shall be limited to the time between 
9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m. 

 

(6) All fires shall be diligently supervised by at least one person who is 18 years of 
age or older. 

 

(7)  There shall be a minimum of a garden hose connected to a reliable water supply, 
a bucket filled with no less than two (2) gallons of clean water, or a properly 
functioning portable fire extinguisher, rated 2-A; 10-B, C, in plain view and 
within fifteen (15) feet from any wood-burning unit. 

 



6 
 

(8)  The wood-burning unit shall be no wider than three (3) feet in diameter and no 
higher than three (3) feet above the base of the wood-burning unit, which makes 
direct contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit. 
A chiminea shall be no higher than five (5) feet above the base, which makes 
direct contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the chiminea. 

 

(9)  The wood-burning unit shall be enclosed on all sides and the bottom, and shall 
have a metallic screen or cover that completely covers the top of the wood-
burning unit. The metallic screen or cover covering the top of the wood-burning 
unit shall be no larger than one-third-inch metallic meshing. Burning materials 
shall be completely contained within the wood-burning unit. The wood-burning 
unit shall only be constructed of metal, concrete, clay, or other similar non-
combustible materials. 

 

(10)  The materials being burned in the wood-burning unit shall not make direct 
contact with the ground. The base of the wood-burning unit, which makes direct 
contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit, shall 
not make direct contact with the ground. 

 

(11)  The wood-burning unit shall only be used with the express permission of the 
property owner or tenant. 

 

(12)  The wood-burning unit shall only be used at a one-family or two-family 
dwelling. 

 

(13)  Any user of a wood-burning unit shall comply with the directions, instructions, 
and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the wood-burning unit. If the 
directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer conflict with 
any provision in this section, the provision in this section shall control. 

 

(14)  There shall only be one (1) active wood-burning unit at a property at a time. 

 

(f) A manufactured gas fire device may be used in the City of Jackson at one or two-family 
dwellings and non-residential property only if it is used in accordance with all of the 
following provisions: 

 

(1) The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used to burn flammable gas. The 
manufactured gas fire device shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, 
grass clippings, wood, or any material or substance other than flammable gas. 
 



7 
 

(2) At one or two family dwellings, the manufactured gas fire device shall be located in 
the rear yard only. For the purpose of this section, on corner lots, the rear yard shall 
be considered the yard opposite the street on which the front door of the house faces. 

 

(3) The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than five (5) feet from 
any portion of a structure in any direction, including above the manufactured gas fire 
device. The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than fifteen (15) 
feet from any neighboring property line. The manufactured gas fire device shall be 
located no closer than ten (10) feet from any other manufactured gas fire device, 
wood-burning unit, or outdoor burning. 

 

(4) The manufactured gas fire device shall not cause a nuisance to neighbors. 
Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be deemed a nuisance and is 
prohibited. 

 

(5) At one or two family dwellings, operation of a manufactured gas fire device shall be 
limited to the time between 9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m. 

 

(6) All manufactured gas fire devices shall be diligently supervised by at least one 
person who is 18 years of age or older when the gas fire device is in use. 

 

(8)The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used with the express permission of 
the property owner or tenant. 

 

(9) Any user of a manufactured gas fire device shall comply with the directions, 
instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the manufactured gas 
fire device. If the directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the 
manufacturer conflict with any provision in this section, the provision in this section 
shall control. 

 

(10) At non-residential property, the owner of a manufactured gas fire device that will 
be placed in a public right-of-way shall complete an application for revocable 
license and pay the required fee to the Clerk's office. The application must also 
include a general liability insurance certificate verifying that the owner of the 
manufactured gas fire device is insured against personal injury and property damage 
arising out of the use or possession of the manufactured gas fire device. The owner 
shall also provide to the City of Jackson an insurance endorsement stating that the 
City of Jackson is an additional insured, and it must be in a reasonable coverage 
amount established by the City Attorney to ensure the City's protection. Upon 
receipt of a completed application for a revocable license, the application shall be 



8 
 

placed on the next regularly scheduled City Council meeting for City Council 
action. All complete applications for a revocable license must either be denied or 
approved and executed within sixty (60) days of receipt. If the application for the 
revocable license is approved by the City Council, the Mayor and Clerk shall 
execute the revocable license. Any complete application that is not denied within 
sixty (60) days of receipt shall be deemed approved. 

 

(11) At non-residential property, a manufactured gas fire device shall only be in use 
during the hours that the business is open. 

 

(g) Exceptions. Subsections (c), (e), and (f) do not apply to: 

 

(1) Grilling or cooking food using charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in cooking 
appliances, braziers, hibachis, grills, outdoor fireplaces or gas-fired stoves. 
 

(2) The temporary use of propane, acetylene, natural gas, gasoline or kerosene in a 
device intended for construction or maintenance activities. 

 

(3) The temporary use of non-ash producing fuels being used not less than 15 feet from 
combustible materials, when used in metal containers for the heating of building 
materials or for the warmth of workers. 

 

(4) Outdoor burning by the City Fire Department in connection with training and 
performance of its duties. 

 

(h) The City fire department and police department are authorized to enforce this section. 

 

(i) A City official or employee enforcing this section may require the owner, tenant, 
occupant, guest, or any other person at the property to extinguish any outdoor fire that 
creates a fire hazard, is a nuisance, is reasonably objectionable, or is unsafe. If there are 
no capable, available, or willing people at the property to extinguish an outdoor fire, the 
City official or employee may extinguish the outdoor fire. 

 

(j) Charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in cooking appliances, braziers, hibachis, grills, 
stoves, or other similar devices when in use outdoors for cooking or heating purposes, 
shall not be used or kindled on any balcony, shall not be used or kindled under any 
overhanging portion of a structure, and shall be located no closer than ten (10) feet from 
any portion of a structure in any direction, including above, at property that has a 
structure or structures that contain more than two dwelling units. 

 



9 
 

(k) Any provision or requirement in Section F-403.0 may be waived or modified only with 
the express written permission of the City Fire Department or approval by the City 
Council. 

 

(l) Between the passage date of this ordinance and the effective date of this ordinance, any 
provision or requirement in Section F-403.0 may be waived or modified only with the 
express written permission of the City Fire Department or approval by the City Council. 

 

Sec. F-514.0. Fire alarm systems. Section F-514.11 is added to read as follows: 

  F-514.11. Key boxes; installation; contents. A key box of a type approved by the 
fire official may be required when a property is protected by an automatic fire alarm system 
and access to the property is made unusually difficult because of secured doors or other 
openings. 

 Such key box, when installed, shall contain all of the following: 

(1) Keys to locked points of ingress whether on the interior or exterior of such 
buildings. 
 

(2) Keys to locked mechanical equipment rooms. 

 

(3) Keys to locked electrical rooms. 

 

(4) Keys to elevator controls. 

 

(5) Keys to other areas as deemed necessary by the fire official. 

 

Sec. F-3003.0. General requirements. Section F-3003.2 is amended to read as follows: 

  F-3003.2. Establishment of limits; storage of explosives. The storage of explosives 
and blasting agents is prohibited within all zoning designations of property within the city 
except those areas designated as "M" industrial properties by the zoning code of the City of 
Jackson; provided, however, that temporary storage not to exceed five (5) continuous days 
in conjunction with approved blasting operations shall be permissible. 

 It shall not be deemed unlawful under this section to store wholesale and retail 
stocks of small arms ammunition, explosive bolts, explosive rivets, or cartridges for 
explosive-activated power tools in quantities involving less than five hundred (500) pounds 
of explosive material. 

Appendices 



10 
 

Appendix A. The following sections of Appendix A of the BOCA National Fire Prevention Code 
of 1996 are amended as set forth herein: 

  Section 1. Adoption of fire control measures and regulations. There is hereby adopted by the 
City of Jackson the fire control measures and regulations as herein set forth for the purposes of 
controlling conditions which could impede or interfere with fire suppression forces. 

  Section 6. Definition of authorized emergency vehicle. Authorized emergency vehicles shall 
be restricted to those which are defined and authorized under the laws of the State of Michigan. 

 

Sec. 10-53. - Amendments, deletions and additions. 

The following sections and subsections of the ICC, 2015 International Fire Code, 
are hereby amended or deleted as set forth, and additional sections and subsections are 
added as indicated. Subsequent section numbers used in this section shall refer to the 
like-numbered sections of such fire prevention code. 

Sec. 101.1. The following portions of Section 101.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Prevention Code of the City of 
Jackson, hereinafter referred to as “this Code”. 

Sec.108.1. The following portions of Section 108.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Application for appeal. Whenever the director shall disapprove of an application 
or refuse to grant a permit hereunder, or when it is claimed the provisions of this code do 
not apply or the true intent of the code has been misinterpreted, the applicant may appeal 
in writing to the City of Jackson Building Code Board of Examiners and Appeals (the 
“Board”) within thirty (30) days from the date of the disapproval of the application or 
refusal to grant a permit. 

Section 108.3 is deleted in its entirety.1  

Sec. 109.3. Notice of Violation. The following portions of Section 109.3 are amended to provide 
as follows: 

Violation Penalties. Person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail 
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or 
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code 
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of 
a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $500.00 or by imprisonment not 

                                                           
1 Attached to this packet, please find a print out of Section 108.3 of the IFC in its entirety. These show the language 
as adopted by the ICC. The City is proposing to amend the language used by the ICC in the IFC.  



11 
 

exceeding 90 days, or both such fine or imprisonment. Each day that a violation 
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

Sec. 113.1. Fees. The following portions of Section 113.1 are amended to provide as follows: 

Fees. A permit shall not be issued until the fees have been paid, nor shall an 
amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid. Fees 
shall be set by Resolution of the City Council. 

Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, 312, 313, and 314. Outdoor Burning. The following portions 
of Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, 312, 313, and 314 are amended to provide as follows2: 

 

307.1   This section applies to all outdoor burning and open burning within the City of 
Jackson. 

 

307.2  Definitions. 

 
307.2.1  Clean wood means seasoned, dry, and natural wood which has not been 
painted, varnished or coated with a similar material, has not been pressure treated with 
preservatives, and does not contain resins or glues as in plywood or other composite 
wood products. 

 

307.2.2   Construction and demolition waste means building waste materials, including 
but not limited to waste shingles, insulation, lumber, treated wood, painted wood, 
wiring, plastics, packaging, and rubble that results from construction, remodeling, 
repair, and demolition operations on a house, commercial or industrial building, or 
other structure. 

 
307.2.3   Manufactured gas fire device means a manufactured gas burning device used 
for outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

307.2.4 Open burning means kindling or maintaining a fire where the products of 
combustion are emitted into the ambient air without passing through a stack or a 
chimney. 

 

307.2.5 Outdoor burning means open burning, burning in a wood-burning unit, or 
burning in a manufactured gas fire device. 

 

                                                           
2 Attached to this packet, please find a print out of Sections 307 to 314 of the IFC in their entirety. These show the 
language as adopted by the ICC. The City is proposing to amend the language used by the ICC in the IFC.  



12 
 

307.2.6  Wood-burning unit means a manufactured wood burning device (including a 
chiminea) used for outdoor recreation and/or heating. 

 

307.3  General prohibition on outdoor burning. Outdoor burning is prohibited unless 
specifically permitted by this section. 

 

307.4  Outdoor burning of refuse, brush, leaves, waste, and grass clippings prohibited. 
Outdoor burning of refuse is prohibited including the burning of brush, leaves, waste, and 
grass clippings. 

 

307.5   A wood-burning unit may be used in the City of Jackson only if it is used in 
accordance with all of the following provisions: 

 

307.5.1  The wood-burning unit shall only be used to burn clean wood. The wood-
burning unit shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, grass clippings, or 
any material or substance other than clean wood. 

 
307.5.2 The wood-burning unit shall be located in the rear yard only. For the purpose 
of this section only, on corner lots, the rear yard shall be considered the yard opposite 
the street on which the front door of the house faces. 

 

307.5.3 The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than twenty-five (25) feet 
from any structure. The wood-burning unit shall be located no closer than fifteen (15) 
feet from any neighboring property line. 
 

307.5.4.  The wood-burning unit or burning materials within the unit shall not cause a 
nuisance to neighbors. Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be 
deemed a nuisance and is prohibited. 
 

307.5.5 Operational hours for any wood-burning unit shall be limited to the time 
between 9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m.  
 

307.5.6 All fires shall be diligently supervised by at least one person who is eighteen 
(18) years of age or older.  
 

307.5.7 There shall be a minimum of a garden hose connected to a reliable water 
supply, a bucket filled with no less than two (2) gallons of clean water, or a properly 
functioning portable fire extinguisher, rated 2-A; 10-B, C, in plain view and within 
fifteen (15) feet from any wood-burning unit. 
 



13 
 

307.5.8 The wood-burning unit shall be no wider than three (3) feet in diameter and 
no higher than three (3) feet above the base of the wood-burning unit, which makes 
direct contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit. A 
chiminea shall be no higher than five (5) feet above the base, which makes direct 
contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the chiminea. 
 

307.5.9 The wood-burning unit shall be enclosed on all sides and the bottom, and 
shall have a metallic screen or cover that completely covers the top of the wood-
burning unit. The metallic screen or cover covering the top of the wood-burning unit 
shall be no larger than one-third-inch metallic meshing. Burning materials shall be 
completely contained within the wood-burning unit. The wood-burning unit shall only 
be constructed of metal, concrete, clay, or other similar non-combustible materials. 

 

307.5.10 The materials being burned in the wood-burning unit shall not make direct 
contact with the ground. The base of the wood-burning unit, which makes direct 
contact with the bottom of the burning materials in the wood-burning unit, shall not 
make direct contact with the ground. 
 

307.5.11 The wood-burning unit shall only be used with the express permission of the 
property owner or tenant. 
 

307.5.12 The wood-burning unit shall only be used at a one-family or two-family 
dwelling. 
 

307.5.13 Any user of a wood-burning unit shall comply with the directions, 
instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the wood-burning unit. If 
the directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer conflict with 
any provision in this section, the provision in this section shall control. 
 

307.5.14 There shall only be one (1) active wood-burning unit at a property at a time. 

 

308.1  A manufactured gas fire device may be used in the City of Jackson at one or two-family 
dwellings and non-residential property only if it is used in accordance with all of the following 
provisions: 

 

308.1.1 The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used to burn flammable gas. 
The manufactured gas fire device shall not be used to burn refuse, waste, brush, leaves, 
grass clippings, wood, or any material or substance other than flammable gas. 
 
308.1.2 At one or two family dwellings, the manufactured gas fire device shall be 
located in the rear yard only. For the purpose of this section, on corner lots, the rear 



14 
 

yard shall be considered the yard opposite the street on which the front door of the 
house faces. 
 

308.1.3 The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than five (5) 
feet from any portion of a structure in any direction, including above the manufactured 
gas fire device. The manufactured gas fire device shall be located no closer than fifteen 
(15) feet from any neighboring property line. The manufactured gas fire device shall be 
located no closer than ten (10) feet from any other manufactured gas fire device, wood-
burning unit, or outdoor burning. 
 

308.1.4 The manufactured gas fire device shall not cause a nuisance to neighbors. 
Reasonably objectionable smoke, odor, or smell shall be deemed a nuisance and is 
prohibited. 
 

308.1.5 At one or two family dwellings, operation of a manufactured gas fire device 
shall be limited to the time between 9:00 a.m. through 11:00 p.m. 
 

308.1.6 All manufactured gas fire devices shall be diligently supervised by at least 
one person who is eighteen (18) years of age or older when the gas fire device is in 
use. 
 

308.1.7 The manufactured gas fire device shall only be used with the express 
permission of the property owner or tenant. 
 

308.1.8 Any user of a manufactured gas fire device shall comply with the 
directions, instructions, and warnings provided by the manufacturer of the 
manufactured gas fire device. If the directions, instructions, and warnings provided by 
the manufacturer conflict with any provision in this section, the provision in this 
section shall control. 
 

308.1.9 At non-residential property, the owner of a manufactured gas fire device 
that will be placed in a public right-of-way shall complete an application for revocable 
license and pay the required fee to the Clerk's office. The application must also include 
a general liability insurance certificate verifying that the owner of the manufactured 
gas fire device is insured against personal injury and property damage arising out of 
the use or possession of the manufactured gas fire device. The owner shall also provide 
to the City of Jackson an insurance endorsement stating that the City of Jackson is an 
additional insured, and it must be in a reasonable coverage amount established by the 
City Attorney to ensure the City's protection. Upon receipt of a completed application 
for a revocable license, the application shall be placed on the next regularly scheduled 
City Council meeting for City Council action. All complete applications for a 
revocable license must either be denied or approved and executed within sixty (60) 



15 
 

days of receipt. If the application for the revocable license is approved by the City 
Council, the Mayor and Clerk shall execute the revocable license. Any complete 
application that is not denied within sixty (60) days of receipt shall be deemed 
approved. 
 
308.1.10 At non-residential property, a manufactured gas fire device shall only be in 
use during the hours that the business is open. 

 

309.1  Exceptions. Subsections 307.3, 307.5, and 308.1 do not apply to: 

 

309.1.1  Grilling or cooking food using charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in 
cooking appliances, braziers, hibachis, grills, outdoor fireplaces or gas-fired stoves. 

 
309.1.2  The temporary use of propane, acetylene, natural gas, gasoline or kerosene 
in a device intended for construction or maintenance activities. 
 

309.1.3 The temporary use of non-ash producing fuels being used not less than 
fifteen (15) feet from combustible materials, when used in metal containers for the 
heating of building materials or for the warmth of workers. 
 

309.1.4 Outdoor burning by the City Fire Division in connection with training and 
performance of its duties. 

 

310.1  The department of police and fire services is authorized to enforce this section. 

 

311.1  A City official or employee enforcing this section may require the owner, tenant, 
occupant, guest, or any other person at the property to extinguish any outdoor fire that creates 
a fire hazard, is a nuisance, is reasonably objectionable, or is unsafe. If there are no capable, 
available, or willing people at the property to extinguish an outdoor fire, the City official or 
employee may extinguish the outdoor fire. 
 

312.1  Charcoal cookers, propane or natural gas in cooking appliances, braziers, hibachis, 
grills, stoves, or other similar devices when in use outdoors for cooking or heating purposes, 
shall not be used or kindled on any balcony, shall not be used or kindled under any 
overhanging portion of a structure, and shall be located no closer than ten (10) feet from any 
portion of a structure in any direction, including above, at property that has a structure or 
structures that contain more than two dwelling units. 

 

313.1  Any provision or requirement in Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, and 312 may be 
waived or modified only with the express written permission of the City Fire Division or 
approval by the City Council. 



16 
 

 

314.1  Between the passage date of this ordinance and the effective date of this ordinance, any 
provision or requirement in Sections 307, 308, 309, 310, 311, and 312 may be waived or 
modified only with the express written permission of the City Fire Division or approval by the 
City Council. 
 

Sec. 506.1. Key boxes; installation; contents. The following portions of Section 506.1 are 
amended to provide as follows: 

Key boxes; installation; contents. A key box of a type approved by the fire 
official shall be required when a property is protected by an automatic fire alarm system 
or access to the property is made unusually difficult because of secured doors or other 
openings. Such key box, when installed, shall contain all of the following: 

1. Keys to locked points of ingress whether on the interior or exterior of such 
buildings. 
 

2. Keys to locked mechanical equipment rooms. 
 

3. Keys to locked electrical rooms. 
 

4. Keys to elevator controls. 
 

5. Keys to other areas as deemed necessary by the fire official. 
 

Sec. 560.4. Explosive materials storage and handling. The following portions of Section 560.4 
are amended to provide as follows:   

5604.1 General. Storage of explosives and explosive materials, small arms 
ammunition, small arms primers, propellant-actuated cartridges and smokeless 
propellants in magazines shall comply with the provisions of this section. The storage of 
explosives and blasting agents is prohibited within all zoning designations of property 
within the city except those areas designated as I-1 or I-2 industrial properties and C-1, 
C-2, C-3, or C-4, commercial districts by the zoning code of the City of Jackson; 
provided, however, that temporary storage not to exceed five (5) continuous days in 
conjunction with approved blasting operations shall be permissible. 

 It shall not be deemed unlawful under this section to store wholesale and retail 
stocks of small arms ammunition, explosive bolts, explosive rivets, or cartridges for 
explosive-activated power tools in quantities involving less than five hundred (500) 
pounds of explosive material. 

Sec. 10-54. - Districts in which storage of flammable liquids and explosives prohibited. 



17 
 

The limits referred to in the fire prevention code adopted by this article which restrict or 
prohibit the storage of explosives and blasting agents, Sec. 5601; flammable liquids, Sec. 5701; 
and storage of liquefied petroleum gas, Sec. 6101et seq., are hereby established for all zoning 
districts created by section 28-31 of the city code except "I" industrial districts. 

Sec. 10-55. - Appeals. 

Whenever the director of police and fire services shall disapprove an application or refuse 
to grant a permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the code adopted by this 
article do not apply or that the true intent and meaning of such code have been misconstrued or 
wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal from the decision of the director to the building 
board Board of examiners and appeals within thirty (30) days from the date of the decision 
appealed. 

Secs. 10-56—10-69. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE IV. - HAZARDOUS MATERIAL (HAZMAT) UNIT 

Sec. 10-7170. - Definitions. 

For purposes of this article, the following definitions shall apply: 

Emergency hazardous material incident means a spill, leakage, release, or other 
dissemination or threat of same of any hazardous materials requiring immediate action to 
mitigate a threat to public health, safety or welfare. 

Expenses shall include but not be limited to the actual labor costs to the city and its 
personnel including Workers' Compensation benefits, fringe benefits, administrative overhead, 
costs of equipment, costs of equipment operation, costs and materials, costs of disposal, costs of 
any contract labor and materials, and those costs associated with an emergency hazardous 
materials incident, in order to ensure the safety of the city and its populace. Expenses shall also 
include the charges or costs incurred by the city as a result of a HazMat unit response to an 
emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Hazardous materials shall include but not necessarily be limited to, all materials 
identified in F-2301.1E102, and materials designated as hazardous by the State of Michigan in 
Public Act 307 of 1982, as amended, or by the Federal Superfund Amendment and 
Reauthorization Act (SARA), as amended. 

HazMat unit means the vehicle provided by the city, individually or pursuant to an 
agreement with another municipality, equipped with apparatus designed to provide emergency 



18 
 

service in situations involving a spill, leak, accident or other similar occurrence involving 
hazardous materials. 

Owner means any individual, firm, company, association, society, corporation, 
partnership, or group, including their officers and employees, who are either listed as the owner 
of record by the Jackson County Register of Deeds, have a land contract vendee interest in, or 
are listed as the taxpayer of record for the real property where the emergency hazardous material 
incident occurred, or have title, use, possession or control of the hazardous material or the 
vehicle used to transport same. 

Person means any individual, firm, company, association, society, corporation, 
partnership, or group, including their officers and employees, who has responsibility for or actual 
involvement in the emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Sec. 10-7271. - Hazardous materials incident emergency. 

In the event a spill, leakage, release, or other dissemination of any hazardous material has 
occurred, the city fire chief, or his/her authorized representative, shall determine whether such 
occurrence constitutes an emergency hazardous materials incident, and if so determined, the city 
may take immediate steps to abate and control the hazardous materials. 

Sec. 10-7372. - Expenses of an emergency hazardous materials incident. 

In the event of an emergency hazardous materials incident, all owners or persons who 
have responsibility for or involvement in the emergency hazardous materials incident shall be 
jointly and severally liable to the city for any expenses incurred in responding to said emergency 
hazardous materials incident. In the event said owner or person fails to pay said expenses within 
sixty (60) days after the city mails its invoice of expenses to said owner or person, the city may 
take such collection efforts to recover said expenses that it deems appropriate, including, but not 
limited to, causing such expenses to be levied and assessed as a special assessment upon the real 
property where the hazardous materials emergency occurred, and collecting the same in the same 
manner as provided in the City Charter; provided, however, such unpaid expenses may not be 
levied as a special assessment against any real property unless the owner, or person in charge of 
or responsible for said real property, has a connection or involvement with the hazardous 
material that resulted in an emergency hazardous materials incident. 

Sec. 10-7473. - Payment of invoice. 

Payment of an invoice for expenses incurred by the city under this article shall not 
constitute an admission of guilt or responsibility under any other ordinance, law, rule, or 
regulation. 



19 
 

Sec. 10-7574. - Repeal of conflicting ordinances.  

All ordinances or parts or ordinances conflicting with the provisions of this article are 
hereby repealed, only to the extent necessary to give this article full force and effect. 

Sec. 10-7675. - Invalidity provision. 

Should the courts declare any provision or section of this article unconstitutional or 
invalid, then such decision shall affect only the section or provision so passed upon, and shall not 
affect any other section or part of this article. 

Sec. 10-7776. - Construction. 

The general penalty provision of section 1-18 of this code shall not apply to this article. 

 
 

Section 3. Effective date. 

This ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days from the date of adoption.  



Jackson City Code of Ordinances: Sections 1-18 and 28-31 

 

Sec. 1-18. - Penalty provision/exceptions. 

(a) Subject to the exceptions contained within subsection (d), unless another penalty is 

expressly provided by this Code for any particular provision or section, every person 

convicted of a violation of any provision of this Code, or any rule, regulation, or order 

adopted or issued in pursuance thereof, shall be punishable by a fine of not more than five 

hundred dollars ($500.00) and costs of prosecution or by imprisonment for not more than 

ninety (90) days, or both such fine, costs and imprisonment in the discretion of the court. 

Costs of prosecution as used herein shall include but not necessarily be limited to 

reasonable attorney fees, witness fees and expenses, police officer costs and expenses, 

city employees' costs and expenses, and any other cost or expense incurred by the city in 

prosecuting the violation. Each act of violation and every day upon which any such violation 

shall occur shall constitute a separate offense. 

 

(b)  The penalty provided by this section, unless another penalty is expressly provided, shall 

apply to the amendment of any section of this Code whether or not such penalty is 

reenacted in the amendatory ordinance. 
 

(c) The penalty shall be in addition to the abatement of the violating condition, any injunctive 

relief, or revocation of any permit or license. 
 

(d) The penalty for a violation of section 18-56 (assault, or assault and battery);section 18-

56.1 (domestic assault); section 18-81 (larceny); section 18-83(malicious destruction of 

property); section 625(l)(a) of the Motor Vehicle Code as adopted by section 25-26 of this 

Code (OWI-operating under influence of alcoholic liquor, a controlled substance, or a 

combination of alcoholic liquor or a controlled substance; section 625(3) of the Motor 

Vehicle Code as adopted by section 25-26 of this Code (impaired driving); and section 904 

of the Motor Vehicle Code as adopted by section 25-26 of this Code (DWLS-driving while 

license suspended) shall be a term of ninety-three (93) days in jail or a fine of five hundred 

dollars ($500.00) or both, as determined by the court. The penalty for a violation of section 

625(1)(c) of the Motor Vehicle Code as adopted by section 25-26 of this Code (0.17 percent 

or more blood alcohol content) shall be punishable by one or more of the following: 

Community service for not more than three hundred sixty (360) hours, imprisonment for not 

more than one hundred eighty (180) days, or a fine of not less than two hundred dollars 

($200.00) or more than seven hundred dollars ($700.00). The penalty for a violation 

of section 18-82 (trespass) shall be a term of thirty (30) days in jail or a fine of two hundred 

fifty dollars ($250.00), or both, as determined by the court. 

 

https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/


(e) Notwithstanding any other provision of this act, a person responsible for a moving violation, 

whether a misdemeanor or civil infraction, in a construction zone, at an emergency scene, or 

in a school zone during the period beginning thirty (30) minutes before school in the morning 

and through thirty (30) minutes after school in the afternoon, is subject to a fine that is 

double the ordinary fine otherwise prescribed for that moving violation. No fine under this 

section may exceed an amount that can lawfully be levied by a court. 

(Code 1977, § 1.13; Ord. No. 99-20, § 1, 10-19-99; Ord. No. 2012.11, § 1, 5-22-12) 

Editor's note— It should be noted that Ord. No. 2000.2, adopted on April 11, 2000 repealed section 

25-28 referenced above in section 1-18(d). 

State Law reference— Limitation on penalties, MCL 117.4i. 

Sec. 28-31. - Enumerated. 

For the purposes of this chapter, the city is hereby divided into the following zoning districts: 

R-1 One-family residential district. 

R-2 One- and two-family residential district. 

R-3 Multiple-family residential district. 

R-4 High density apartment and office district. 

R-5 Mobile home park district. 

R-6 Residential and low intensity office district. 

C-1 Neighborhood commercial district. 

C-2 Community commercial district. 

C-3 Central commercial district. 

C-4 General commercial district. 

I-1 Light industrial district. 

I-2 General industrial district. 

(Code 1977, § 5.21) 

 

https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/
https://www2.municode.com/library/


Page 1 of 3 
 

Amended Sections of the 2015 International Fire Code 
 
[A] 108.3 Qualifications. 
 
The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience and training to 
pass on matters pertaining to hazards of fire, explosions, hazardous conditions or fire protection 
systems, and are not employees of the jurisdiction. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Page 2 of 3 
 

SECTION 307 
 

OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES 

 
307.1 General. 
A person shall not kindle or maintain or authorize to be kindled or maintained any open burning 
unless conducted and approved in accordance with Sections 307.1.1 through 307.5. 
 
307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. 
Open burning shall be prohibited when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make 
such fires hazardous. 
 

Exception: Prescribed burning for the purpose of reducing the impact of wildland fire 
when authorized by the fire code official. 

 
307.2 Permit required. 
A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with Section 105.6 prior to 
kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife management practices, prevention 
or control of disease or pests, or a bonfire. Application for such approval shall only be presented 
by and permits issued to the owner of the land upon which the fire is to be kindled. 
 
307.2.1 Authorization. 
Where required by state or local law or regulations, open burning shall only be permitted with 
prior approval from the state or local air and water quality management authority, provided 
that all conditions specified in the authorization are followed. 
 
307.3 Extinguishment authority. 
When Where open burning creates or adds to a hazardous situation, or a required permit for 
open burning has not been obtained, the fire code official is authorized to order the 
extinguishment of the open burning operation. 
 
307.4 Location. 
The location for open burning shall not be not less than 50 feet (15 240 mm) from any 
structure, and provisions shall be made to prevent the fire from spreading to within 50 feet (15 
240 mm) of any structure. 

 
Exceptions: 
1. Fires in approved containers that are not less than 15 feet (4572 mm) from a 
structure. 
2. The minimum required distance from a structure shall be 25 feet (7620 mm) where the 
pile size is 3 feet (914 mm) or less in diameter and 2 feet (610 mm) or less in height. 

 
307.4.1 Bonfires. 
A bonfire shall not be conducted within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure or combustible 
material unless the fire is contained in a barbecue pit. Conditions which that could cause a 
fire to spread within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 
 
307.4.2 Recreational fires. 
Recreational fires shall not be conducted within 25 feet (7620 mm) of a structure or 



Page 3 of 3 
 

combustible material. Conditions which that could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet (7620 
mm) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 
 
307.4.3 Portable outdoor fireplaces. 
Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions 
and shall not be operated within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a structure or combustible material. 
 

Exception: Portable outdoor fireplaces used at one- and one-and two-family dwellings. 
 
307.5 Attendance. 
Open burning, bonfires, recreational fires and use of portable outdoor fireplaces shall be 
constantly attended until the fire is extinguished. A minimum of one portable fire extinguisher 
complying with Section 906 with a minimum 4-A rating or other approved on-site fire-
extinguishing equipment, such as dirt, sand, water barrel, garden hose or water truck, shall be 
available for immediate utilization. 





1 
 

 
 

DEPARTMENT REPORT 
 
MEMO TO:   Honorable Mayor and City Councilmembers 
 
FROM:   Bethany M. Smith, City Attorney  
    Robert C. Rottach, Assistant City Attorney 
 
DATE:   Council Meeting – June 14, 2016 
 
RECOMMENDATION: Please APPROVE the attached Ordinance 
 
 

 

 
The attached ordinance eliminates the optional three (3) year non-owner occupied residential property 
registration and inspection cycle. 

 

 

Currently, City ordinance allows a non-owner occupied residential dwelling, which is eligible for the three 
(3) year registration cycle pursuant to Sec. 14-9.1, the option to register and comply with the two (2) year 
registration cycle provided in Sec. 14-9 or to register and comply with the three (3) year registration cycle 
provided in Sec. 14-9.1. Currently, City ordinance Sec. 14-42.1 also provides that a dwelling that is eligible 
and has registered for the three (3) year registration cycle under 14-9.1 will go without inspection for 
approximately an additional year (3 years total) compared to the two (2) year cycle. The purpose of the 
optional three year non-owner occupied residential property registration and inspection cycle was to reward 
the owners of well-maintained properties with the option of a 3 year cycle compared to a 2 year cycle. 

At the May 24, 2016, Council meeting, this Council approved a new rate to charge property owners for non-
owner occupied residential property inspections. The new rate is calculated based on the amount of time that 
a City inspector spends inspecting the property. Since well-maintained properties will take less time to 
inspect and thus result in a lower inspection fee, the new rate method will inherently reward property 
owners with well-maintained properties.  Furthermore, the new rate method is premised on using a two year 
inspection and registration cycle. Therefore, there is no need for keeping the 3 year registration and 
inspection cycle. This ordinance eliminates the optional 3 year non-owner occupied residential property 
registration and inspection cycle.  

 

 

Please APPROVE the attached proposed Ordinance. 

ATTACHMENTS 

SUMMARY 

HISTORY, BACKGROUND and DISCUSSION 

POSITIONS 



 
 

  Page 1 

ORDINANCE 2016 - _______ 

An Ordinance amending Chapter 14, Sections 14-9.1 and 14-42.1 
of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances, to eliminate the 
optional three year non-owner occupied residential property 
registration and inspection cycle, for the health, safety, and welfare 
of the citizens of the City of Jackson, Michigan. 

 
THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON ORDAIN: 

Section 1. Purpose. 

The City Council adopts this ordinance to eliminate the optional three year non-owner 
occupied residential property registration and inspection cycle, for the health, safety, and welfare 
of the citizens of the City of Jackson, Michigan. 

Section 2.  

 That Chapter 14, Sections 14-9.1 and 14-42.1 of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances 
shall read as follows: 

Sec. 14-9.1. - Optional three-year registration cycle for eligible dwellings. Section 14-9.1 is 
Repealed. 

(a) Eligibility. To be eligible for the three (3) year registration cycle under this section, a non-
owner occupied residential dwelling must do all of the following:  

(1) Receive a certificate of compliance for the most recent initial inspection or the first 
reinspection following the most recent initial inspection; and  

(2) Have received a certificate of compliance during or after the year 2012, but prior to 
receiving the certificate of compliance that makes the dwelling eligible for the three (3) 
year registration cycle.  

(b) Optionality. A non-owner occupied residential dwelling that is eligible for the three (3) year 
registration cycle has the option to register and comply with the two (2) year registration 
cycle provided in section 14-9 or to register and comply with the three (3) year registration 
cycle provided in this section.  

(c) Duration. The registration for a non-owner occupied residential dwelling that registers for 
the three (3) year registration cycle provided in this section is only valid until the last day of 
June before the third July 1st after the most recent certificate of compliance was issued.  

(d) Registration renewal. A renewal property registration under this section must be applied for 
at least sixty (60) days prior to the last day of June before the third July 1st after the 
certificate of compliance was issued.  



 
 

  Page 2 

(e) Refuse removal verification. At the time of registering the property under the three (3) year 
registration cycle provided for in this section, the property owner shall sign a verification 
statement that the property is in full compliance with the requirements of Chapter 12 of the 
City of Jackson's Code of Ordinances.  

(f) Violation. Failure to timely register, apply for, sign the verification statement regarding 
refuse removal, or renew a property registration is a violation of this article and shall subject 
the applicant to late fees. 

 

* *   * 

Sec. 14-42.1. - Issuance of certificate of compliance.  

The certificate of compliance shall be issued only upon an inspection of the premises by the 
chief building official or his or her appointed designee.  

(1) The chief building official shall not issue a certificate of compliance when any existing 
condition constitutes a violation of this article.  

(2) Upon a finding that there is not a condition that would constitute a violation of this 
article, the certificate of compliance shall be issued. Upon a finding that there is a 
condition that would constitute a violation of this article, the certificate of compliance 
shall not be issued, and an order to comply with this article shall be issued immediately 
and served upon the owner in accordance with section 14-45. Upon reinspection and 
proof of compliance, the order shall be rescinded and a certificate of compliance shall 
be issued. Unless stated otherwise, a certificate shall not be valid for a period of more 
than two (2) years from the date of the last initial inspection of the premises. When a 
dwelling has been registered for the three (3) year registration cycle provided in section 
14-9.1, the certificate of compliance shall not be valid for a period of more than three 
(3) years after the date of the most recent initial inspection.  

(3) A certificate of compliance shall be issued on condition that the building or structure 
remains free from violations of this article. If upon reinspection pursuant to section 14-42 
of this article the chief building official determines that conditions exist which constitute 
a violation of this article, the certificate shall be immediately suspended as to affected 
areas, and an order to comply with this article shall be issued immediately and served 
upon the owner in accordance with section 14-45 of this article. On reinspection and 
proof of compliance, the order shall be rescinded and the suspended certificate reinstated 
or a new certificate issued. 

 

Section 3.      This Ordinance takes effect thirty (30) days after the date of adoption. 



 
 

  Page 1 

ORDINANCE 2016 - _______ 

An Ordinance amending Chapter 14, Sections 14-9.1 and 14-42.1 
of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances, to eliminate the 
optional three year non-owner occupied residential property 
registration and inspection cycle, for the health, safety, and welfare 
of the citizens of the City of Jackson, Michigan. 

 
THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON ORDAIN: 

Section 1. Purpose. 

The City Council adopts this ordinance to eliminate the optional three year non-owner 
occupied residential property registration and inspection cycle, for the health, safety, and welfare 
of the citizens of the City of Jackson, Michigan. 

Section 2.  

 That Chapter 14, Sections 14-9.1 and 14-42.1 of the City of Jackson Code of Ordinances 
shall read as follows: 

Section 14-9.1 is Repealed. 

 
* *   * 

Sec. 14-42.1. - Issuance of certificate of compliance.  

The certificate of compliance shall be issued only upon an inspection of the premises by the 
chief building official or his or her appointed designee.  

(1) The chief building official shall not issue a certificate of compliance when any existing 
condition constitutes a violation of this article.  

(2) Upon a finding that there is not a condition that would constitute a violation of this 
article, the certificate of compliance shall be issued. Upon a finding that there is a 
condition that would constitute a violation of this article, the certificate of compliance 
shall not be issued, and an order to comply with this article shall be issued immediately 
and served upon the owner in accordance with section 14-45. Upon reinspection and 
proof of compliance, the order shall be rescinded and a certificate of compliance shall 
be issued. Unless stated otherwise, a certificate shall not be valid for a period of more 
than two (2) years from the date of the last initial inspection of the premises.  

(3) A certificate of compliance shall be issued on condition that the building or structure 
remains free from violations of this article. If upon reinspection pursuant to section 14-
42 of this article the chief building official determines that conditions exist which 
constitute a violation of this article, the certificate shall be immediately suspended as to 



 
 

  Page 2 

affected areas, and an order to comply with this article shall be issued immediately and 
served upon the owner in accordance with section 14-45 of this article. On reinspection 
and proof of compliance, the order shall be rescinded and the suspended certificate 
reinstated or a new certificate issued. 

 

Section 3.      This Ordinance takes effect thirty (30) days after the date of adoption. 

































 

 
MEMO TO:   Mayor and City Councilmembers 

 

FROM:  Patrick H. Burtch, City Manager 

 

DATE:  June 14, 2016 

 

SUBJECT: Award a Demolition Contract to Smalley Construction in the Amount of $279,040 

 

 

Recommendation:  
 

Award a Demolition Contract in the Total Amount of $279,040 to Smalley Construction 

through the Help for Hardest Hit Blight Elimination Program. 

 

Attached is a memo from Jennifer Morris, Director of the Department of Neighborhood & Economic 

Operations regarding the award of a demolition contract in the total amount of $279,040 to Smalley 

Construction to demolish 14 residential structures acquired through the Help for Hardest Hit Blight 

Elimination Program. 

 

I recommend approval of the contract award. Your consideration and concurrence is appreciated. 

 

 

 

PHB 
 



 

DEPARTMENTAL REPORT 

 

 

MEMO TO:   Patrick Burtch, City Manager 

 

FROM:   Jennifer L. Morris, Director 

    Department of Neighborhood & Economic Operations 

 

DATE:   June 14, 2016 

 

RECOMMENDATION: Award a Demolition Contract in the Total Amount of $279,040 to Smalley 

Construction through the Help for Hardest Hit Blight Elimination Program 

 

 

SUMMARY 

 

Award a demolition contract in the total amount of $279,040 to Smalley Construction to demolish 14 

residential structures acquired through the Help for Hardest Hit Blight Elimination Program. 

 

BUDGETARY CONSIDERATIONS 

 

Funding for these demolitions originates from the City’s General Pooled Account. Upon full and 

satisfactory completion of the demolition, the City will request reimbursement from the Michigan State 

Housing Development Authority, which is limited to $23,750 per property for acquisition and demolition 

costs. The City’s Demolition Fund covers costs exceeding the $23,750 per property cap. 

  

HISTORY, BACKGROUND and DISCUSSION 

 

On June 13, 2016, sealed bids to demolish 14 properties meeting the criteria of the Help for Hardest Hit  

Blight Elimination Program were opened and processed. When bidding demolition contracts, contractors 

are required to submit pricing for the entire package and individual units (cost to demolish an individual 

structure); contractors also have the option to submit an alternate (discounted) bid if awarded the entire 

package. City staff conducted a cost analysis to develop and support the recommendation made herein.  

 
  



DISCUSSION OF THE ISSUE 

 

Two contractors submitted sealed bids with bid package totals as follows: 

 

Contractor 

Total Bid 

Amount Submitted 

Smalley Construction $279,040 

Blue Star, Inc. $365,300 

 

Neither contractor submitted a bid providing an alternate (discounted) price if awarded all 14 properties 

in the bid package. Smalley Construction’s overall low bid is 30.9% less than that submitted by Blue Star, 

Inc., providing a cost savings to the City of $86,260 or an average of over $6,000 per property.  

 

Blue Star did submit one individual unit price which was $450 lower than the single price submitted by 

Smalley Construction; however, the cost savings to the City by awarding two contracts based on 

individual pricing is nominal. Further, it is unlikely this first time bidder with the City would be willing to 

mobilize a crew from Warren to Jackson to complete one demolition. As such, results of the analysis 

determined the City would realize the greatest cost savings by awarding a single contract based on the 

overall low bid submitted by Smalley Construction: 

 

Bid Type Contractor Total Amount Savings to City 

Overall Low Bid Smalley Construction $279,040 $86,260 

Low Alternate Bid n/a n/a  

Individual Pricing 

 13 properties: 

 1 property: 

 

Smalley Construction 

Blue Star, Inc. 

$278,590 $450 

 

 

POSITIONS 

 

Requested action is for City Council to award a single demolition contract to Smalley Construction in the 

amount of $279,040 to demolish 14 residential structures through the Help for Hardest Hit Blight 

Elimination Program. 

 
  

ATTACHMENTS 

 Bid Tabulation 

 Cost Analysis 



BID TABULATION FOR
HELP FOR HARDEST HIT

BLIGHT ELIMINATION PROGRAM - PACKAGE H
MONDAY, JUNE 13, 2016, 10:00 AM

ITEM 
NO

ADDRESS LOCATION
BUILDING 

TYPE
DIRT GRADE SEED SIDEWALK

DEMOLITION 
COST

ASBESTOS 
ABATEMENT 

COST

TOTAL 
DEMOLITION 

COST
DIRT GRADE SEED SIDEWALK

DEMOLITION 
COST

ASBESTOS 
ABATEMENT 

COST

TOTAL 
DEMOLITION 

COST

1 127 E. Mansion St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,020  $     306  $     204  $       1,170  $           8,670  $              750  $         12,120  $    2,400  $     400  $     500  $       1,500  $         11,300  $              800  $         16,900 

2 135 E. Addison St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $       840  $     252  $     168  $       2,470  $           7,140  $           9,000  $         19,870  $    3,200  $     400  $     500  $       3,000  $         11,800  $         12,000  $         30,900 

3 215 E. Biddle St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    2,090  $     627  $     418  $       7,110  $         17,765  $              760  $         28,770  $    4,900  $     400  $     500  $       7,000  $         18,900  $           2,000  $         33,700 

4 221 W. High St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,639  $     492  $     328  $       2,280  $         13,931  $              650  $         19,320  $    6,700  $     400  $     500  $       2,700  $         23,400  $              900  $         34,600 

5 334 N. Gorham

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,628  $     488  $     326  $       1,920  $         13,838  $              550  $         18,750  $    2,500  $     400  $     500  $       2,500  $         11,600  $              800  $         18,300 

6 444 Steward Ave

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $       996  $     299  $     199  $       2,070  $           8,466  $              550  $         12,580  $    2,700  $     400  $     500  $       2,500  $         11,500  $              800  $         18,400 

7 602 Seymour Ave

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,176  $     353  $     235  $       2,280  $           9,996  $              750  $         14,790  $    2,400  $     400  $     500  $       2,900  $         11,600  $           1,900  $         19,700 

8 607 Fourth St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,859  $     557  $     372  $       2,700  $         15,802  $           2,900  $         24,190  $    3,800  $     400  $     500  $       3,500  $         14,300  $           4,300  $         26,800 

9 611 Homewild Ave

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,140  $     342  $     228  $       1,080  $           9,690  $         11,000  $         23,480  $    5,200  $     400  $     500  $       1,300  $         11,900  $         15,100  $         34,400 

10 811 Burr St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,380  $     414  $     276  $       1,710  $         11,730  $                   -  $         15,510  $    3,100  $     400  $     500  $       2,300  $         13,400  $              200  $         19,900 

11 1010 Greenwood Ave

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,104  $     331  $     221  $       1,650  $           9,384  $              550  $         13,240  $    3,400  $     400  $     500  $       2,300  $         11,700  $           1,500  $         19,800 

Blue Star, Inc.
21950 Hoover

Warren, MI 48089

Smalley Construction
131 S. Main St.

Scottville, MI 49454



BID TABULATION FOR
HELP FOR HARDEST HIT

BLIGHT ELIMINATION PROGRAM - PACKAGE H
MONDAY, JUNE 13, 2016, 10:00 AM

ITEM 
NO

ADDRESS LOCATION
BUILDING 

TYPE
DIRT GRADE SEED SIDEWALK

DEMOLITION 
COST

ASBESTOS 
ABATEMENT 

COST

TOTAL 
DEMOLITION 

COST
DIRT GRADE SEED SIDEWALK

DEMOLITION 
COST

ASBESTOS 
ABATEMENT 

COST

TOTAL 
DEMOLITION 

COST

Blue Star, Inc.
21950 Hoover

Warren, MI 48089

Smalley Construction
131 S. Main St.

Scottville, MI 49454

12 1027 Hamilton St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,350  $     405  $     270  $          900  $         11,475  $              500  $         14,900  $    3,300  $     400  $     500  $       1,100  $         11,500  $              800  $         17,600 

13 1137 Plymouth St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    3,245  $     974  $     649  $       8,280  $         27,582  $           2,300  $         43,030  $    9,500  $     400  $     500  $       8,300  $         27,100  $           1,600  $         47,400 

14 1415 First St

EVERY 
STRUCTURE 

ON 
PROPERTY

 $    1,380  $     414  $     276  $       3,990  $         11,730  $              700  $         18,490  $    4,000  $     400  $     500  $       4,700  $         15,700  $           1,600  $         26,900 

20,847$   6,254$   4,170$   39,610$      177,199$        30,960$          279,040$        57,100$   5,600$   7,000$   45,600$      44,300$          365,300$        Total Bid

$412,355 Discount if awarded all 14 properties



H4HH Bid Package H

Cost Analysis Conducted June 14, 2016

PIN Address Ward  Smalley Const. Blue Star Inc. Low Unit Cost

5-173200000 127 E Mansion St 1 12,120.00$               16,900.00$               12,120.00$               

5-175400000 135 E Addison St 1 19,870.00$               30,900.00$               19,870.00$               

5-058000000 215 E Biddle St 5 28,770.00$               33,700.00$               28,770.00$               

4-137000000 221 W High St 1 19,320.00$               34,600.00$               19,320.00$               

8-022500000 334 N Gorham St 3 18,750.00$               18,300.00$               18,300.00$               

2-102600000 444 Steward Ave 4 12,580.00$               18,400.00$               12,580.00$               

8-095600000 602 Seymour Ave 3 14,790.00$               19,700.00$               14,790.00$               

3-021100000 607 Fourth St 5 24,190.00$               26,800.00$               24,190.00$               

7-035100000 611 Homewild Ave 2 23,480.00$               34,400.00$               23,480.00$               

7-022600000 811 Burr St 2 15,510.00$               19,900.00$               15,510.00$               

4-121800000 1010 Greenwood Ave 1 13,240.00$               19,800.00$               13,240.00$               

8-241300000 1027 Hamilton St 3 14,900.00$               17,600.00$               14,900.00$               

6-035700000 1137 Plymouth St 2 43,030.00$               47,400.00$               43,030.00$               

4-140300000 1415 First St 1 18,490.00$               26,900.00$               18,490.00$               

279,040.00$      365,300.00$      278,590.00$      Totals:


	6-14-16 City Council Meeting Agenda
	6. Presentations/Proclamations
	A. Special Tribute - Great Lakes Caring

	8. Consent Calendar
	A. 5-24-16 Minutes
	B. DDA Appointment
	C. CDBG HOME Financial Summaries
	D. Activate Jackson 2016: Lighter, Quicker, Cheaper Placemaking

	10. Other Business
	A. Final Adoption Ord. No. 2016-12
	B. Revised Final Allocation HOME

	11. New Business
	A. Reimbursement Resolution-Street Improvement Projects
	B. Resolution - MDOT Contract for Mechanic St.
	C. Ord., Fire Prevention & Protection
	D. Ord. NOORP Registration & Inspection
	E. Street Sweeping Contract
	F. Purchase of Water & Wastewater Treatment Chemicals
	G. Commercial Redevelopment Dist.
	*H. Demo Contract Award




