BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

NAME: American Merchandising Services Government Scientific Source VWR International LLC Saturo Technologies, LLC
MAILING ADDRESS: PO Box 12408 12351 Sunrise Valley Dr. 800 E. Fabyan Parkway PIO box 23282
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Cleveland, OH 44112 Reston, VA 20191 Batavia, IL 60510 Toledo, OH 43623
CONTACT PERSON: Brandon King Nick Williams Amanda Harness Isabelle Karakas
TITLE: Vice President Sales Account Representative Quotations Supervisor President
TELEPHONE: (216) 249-2626 (800) 248-8030 (800) 932-5000 (419) 534-9870
EMAIL ADDRESS: nwilliams@govsci.com usbids@vwr.comn ikarakas@saturotechnologies.com
ITEM PRODUCT ITEM PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
45 packs of |Pall Life Science Petri Dishes with Pads Pall No.
1/100 7245 7245 42.22 1,899.90|25388-640 42.22 41.90| 1,885.50/25388-640 42.22 33.78| 1,520.10|ST-F3000-3 54.30 52.00| 2,340.00
4 packs of
2]|1000 Pall Life Science Membrane Filters Pall No. 66068 66068 536.96 2,147.84]28148-813 430.66 427.43 1,709.72(28148-813 430.66 301.46] 1,205.84|ST-F3002-10 670.00 625.00]1 2,500.00
Sterilization Wrap Autoclavable, 18" X 18" Fisher
3|6 cases Scientific Cat. No. 191500010 19-150-0010 103.69 622.14|19-150-0010 103.69 92.97 557.82(59100-230 97.28 58.37 350.22|ST-4018 73.70 33.35 200.10
4 cases of |Disposable Culture Dishes Fisher Scientific Cat.
4(500 No. 08-757-12 08-757-12 179.00 716.00|08-757-12 179.00 98.45 393.80(25384-342 176.84 59.75 239.00|ST-D1906 231.00 58.13 232.52
2 packs of |ATI Sterilometer VWR Scientific Cat. No. 34010-
5[200 034 34010-034 32.25 64.50|34010-034 28.37 28.37 56.74|34010-034 32.25 22.62 45.24|ST-PW00119 24.53 22.00 44.00
Autoclave Indicator Tape Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
6[10 rolls 15-904 15-904 5.69 56.90/15-904 5.69 4.77 47.70|36432-188 9.21 5.99 59.90|ST-L1600-75A 26.00 6.25 62.50
2 cases of |French Square Bottles, clear wide mouth Fisher
7124 Scientific Cat. No. 02911389 02-911-389 155.13 310.26|02-911-389 155.13 93.08 186.16/89043-770 144.18 34.60 69.20|ST-B7401-675 135.00 30.80 61.60
1 cases of [Coliform Sampling Containers with tablet Corning
8|100 No. 1700-100 1700-100 66.04 132.08]|1700-100 65.93 49.45 49.45166175-105 65.93 49.45 49.45|ST-W2723-5 69.90 59.50 59.50
10 packs of |Autoclavable Rubber Lined Screw Caps VWR
9|12 Scientific Cat. No. 16215-130 16215-130 28.03 280.30{16215-130 27.99 20.17 201.70{16215-130 28.03 9.81 98.10|ST-B7503-84A 14.00 9.73 97.30
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
10|1 each No. 15-059-337 15-059-337 53.02 53.02|15-059-337 53.02 41.44 41.44161019-206 61.95 39.65 39.65|ST-T8401-1 40.90 34.80 34.80
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
11|4 each No. 15-059-329 15-059-329 53.01 212.04|15-059-329 53.01 441.44 165.76/61019-196 73.73 47.92 191.68|ST-8401-3 40.90 34.80 139.20
Autoclave Thermometer VWR Scientific Cat. No.
12|1 each 61069-996 61069-996 53.61 53.61|61069-996 53.61 52.99 52.99|61069-996 53.61 34.85 34.85|ST-T8400-165A 52.90 39.45 39.45
1/4 |b. Bottle of M-Endo Broth MF Difco No.
13|7 each 0749024 Difco Cat. No. DF 0749-15 DF 0749-15-9 63.76 63.76 274920 63.00 53.55 374.85[(90003-938 65.08 52.06 364.42|ST-0749-15 64.10 56.00 392.00
100 g Bottle of Brillant Green Bile 2% BBL Cat. No.
14|1 each 11079 DF 00007-15-6 67.73 67.73 273000 66.00 56.76 56.76/90003-898 68.44 54.75 54.75
15|1 each 500 gram Bottle of EC Broth BBL Cat. No. 11187 [CMO0853B 86.81 86.81 231430 119.00 96.39 96.39|EMI-10765-0500 81.24 56.87 56.87|ST-1107650500 86.60 69.16 69.16
1/4 Ib. Bottles of Plate Count Agar Difco Cat. No.
16|12 each 0479-15 DF 0479-15-5 46.17 554.04 247930 45.00 38.70 464.40|90003-408 46.89 37.51 450.12|ST-0479-15 46.20 40.00 480.00
1/4 Bottle of Lauryl Tryptose Broth Difco Cat. No.
17|1 each 0241-15 DF 0241-15-2 67.73 67.73 224140 66.00 56.76 56.76/90001-768 68.44 54.75 54.75|ST-0241-15 68.00 60.00 60.00
1/4 Bottles of Tryptic Soy Broth Difco Cat. No.
18|13 each 0370-15 DF 0370-15-5 26.12 339.56 211824 26.00 22.10 287.30{90000-376 26.34 21.07 273.91|ST-0370-15 25.90 23.00 299.00
7 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
19|1 case SB109-500 SB109-500 415.54 415.54|SB109-500 415.54 253.15 253.15|EM-BX1627-1 183.30 164.97 164.97|ST-98872 229.80 188.37 188.37
10 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat.
20|2 case No. SB141-500 SB141-500 389.76 779.52|SB141-500 389.76 237.44 474.88|EM-9890-2 38.21 26.75 53.50|ST-98902 229.80 188.37 376.74
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BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

NAME: American Merchandising Services Government Scientific Source VWR International LLC Saturo Technologies, LLC
MAILING ADDRESS: PO Box 12408 12351 Sunrise Valley Dr. 800 E. Fabyan Parkway PIO box 23282
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Cleveland, OH 44112 Reston, VA 20191 Batavia, IL 60510 Toledo, OH 43623
CONTACT PERSON: Brandon King Nick Williams Amanda Harness Isabelle Karakas
TITLE: Vice President Sales Account Representative Quotations Supervisor President
TELEPHONE: (216) 249-2626 (800) 248-8030 (800) 932-5000 (419) 534-9870
EMAIL ADDRESS: nwilliams@govsci.com usbids@vwr.comn ikarakas@saturotechnologies.com
ITEM PRODUCT ITEM PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
1,2-Cyclohexylenedinitritotetraacetic Acid ACS,
21]2 bottles Grade 500 grams Spectrum Cat. No. C1466-500 |C1466-500 555.90 1,111.80|C1466-500 555.90 389.13 778.26|MISC-CHEM-LAB 555.90 528.11] 1,056.22|ST-4931-500 370.00 186.65 373.30
Ferrous Ammonium Sulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher
22|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 177-500 177-500 204.02 204.02(177-3500 204.02 102.01 102.01|EM-FX0245-1 103.03 61.82 61.82|ST-2054-01 208.00 122.71 122.71
Sodium Thiosulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher Scientific
23|1 each Cat. No. S445-500 S445-500 69.86 69.86|5445-500 69.86 34.93 34.93|EM-SX0815-1 41.78 25.07 25.07|ST-3946-01 62.80 37.38 37.38
10 cases of |Sodium Chloride, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific Cat.
246 No. BDH0286-500G BDHO0286-500G 84.01 1,260.15|BDH0286-500G 93.34 93.34 933.40|BDH0286-500G 84.01 44.53 445.30|ST-3624-01 255.60 152.15| 1,521.50
Sodium Hydroxide Pellets, ACS, Grade VWR
25|3 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. BDH0292-500G BDH0292-500G 116.24 348.72|BDH0292-500G 129.16 129.16 387.48|BDH0292-500G 116.24 69.74 209.22|ST-3722-01 268.80 160.05 480.15
Potassium Phosphate Monobasic, ACS, Grade
26|2 case of 4 |VWR Scientific Cat. No. BDH0266-500G BDHO0266-500G 232.53 465.06|BDH0266-500G 258.37 258.37 516.74|BDH0266-500G 232.53 93.01 186.02|ST-3246-05 291.00 172.15 344.30
Hydrochloric Acid 37%, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
272 cases of 6 |Cat. No. EM-HX0603-3 EMD-HX0603-3 166.37 332.74|EMD-HX0603-3 166.37 124.78 249.56 | EMD-HX0603-3 166.37 99.82 199.64|ST-HX06033 345.60 165.60 331.20
Glacial Acetic Acid, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
28]1 case of 6 |Cat. No. MK312104 MK312104 286.52 286.52|MK312104 286.52 226.55 226.55|MK31210Y 286.52 166.95 166.95|ST-2504-500PA 538.80 205.50 205.50
Ammonium Hydroxide, ACS, Grade Fisher
292 bottles Scientific Cat. No. A669-212 A669-212 142.52 285.04|A669-212 142.52 78.39 156.78|BDH3016-2.5LG 40.64 14.22 28.44
Thermo/Orion Ross Refrence Electrode Single
30|1 box Junction Fill Solution Model No. 900001 900001 86.11 86.11 900001 84.00 71.40 71.40|34111-830 85.04 68.03 68.03|ST-H4111-11 85.10 75.00 75.00
Thermo/Ross PH Electrode with BNC Connector
31]|2 each Model No. 8101BNWP 8101 BNWP 260.91 521.82|8101BNWP 258.00 219.30 438.60(10010-754 261.21 208.97 417.94
Thermo/Ross Reference Electrode Double
32]|2 each Junction Model No. 800500 800500 213.00 426.00|800500U 268.00 227.80 455.60|NO BID
Thermo/Orion Flouride Electrode with BNC
33|1 each Connector Model No. 9409BN 9409BN 601.00 601.00{9409BN 601.00 510.85 510.85(34117-010 608.46 486.77 486.77|ST-H4200-12B 640.00 589.28 589.28
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Single
34|1 each Junction Model No. 900100 900100 188.00 188.00 900100 188.00 159.80 159.80(34107-923 190.33 152.26 152.26|ST-H4110-1 192.00 175.00 175.00
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Double
35|1 each Junction Model No. 900200 900200 227.00 227.00 900200 227.00 192.95 192.95|94107-956 229.81 183.85 183.85|ST-H4110-2 232.00 215.00 215.00
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
36|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 02202B 02-202B 109.40 109.40/02-2028B 109.40 59.10 59.10/25433-102 76.31 22.89 22.89|ST-B2045-10 76.60 27.50 27.50
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
37|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 08732117 08-732-117 97.30 97.30|08-732-117 97.30 57.03 57.03|12577-055 74.19 29.68 29.68|ST-B2045-10 76.60 27.50 27.50
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
38|2 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-362|89012-362 97.37 194.74|89012-362 97.37 87.17 174.34|89012-362 97.37 63.29 126.58|ST-B7402-4 114.00 93.90 187.80
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BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

NAME: American Merchandising Services Government Scientific Source VWR International LLC Saturo Technologies, LLC
MAILING ADDRESS: PO Box 12408 12351 Sunrise Valley Dr. 800 E. Fabyan Parkway PIO box 23282
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Cleveland, OH 44112 Reston, VA 20191 Batavia, IL 60510 Toledo, OH 43623
CONTACT PERSON: Brandon King Nick Williams Amanda Harness Isabelle Karakas
TITLE: Vice President Sales Account Representative Quotations Supervisor President
TELEPHONE: (216) 249-2626 (800) 248-8030 (800) 932-5000 (419) 534-9870
EMAIL ADDRESS: nwilliams@govsci.com usbids@vwr.comn ikarakas@saturotechnologies.com
ITEM PRODUCT ITEM PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
39|3 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-364]|89012-364 103.80 311.40|89012-364 103.80 92.94 278.82|89012-364 103.80 67.47 202.41|ST-B7402-6 114.00 93.90 281.70
Ultrapure Cartridges Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
40]8 each 0903525 09-035-25 117.00 936.00|D8902 117.00 95.94 767.52(26303-530 122.78 92.09 736.72|ST-D3984-13 110.00 89.81 718.48
2 cases of |Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
41]12 16651926 16651-926 115.03 920.24(2405-1000 114.00 74.10 148.20/16651-926 115.03 69.02 138.04|ST-B7898-1L 136.50 95.05 190.10
Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
42]2 packs of 416651595 16651-595 48.12 96.24|16651-595 48.12 40.29 80.58[16651-595 48.12 16.84 33.68|ST-B7896-500 24.39 18.96 37.92
Nalgene Carboy with spigot and handle VWR
43]1 each Scientific Cat. No. 16334-220 16334-220 289.60 289.60|16334-220 289.60 242.45 242.45(16334-220 289.60 101.36 101.36|ST-B7586-5XA 142.00 108.32 108.32
Boston Round Bottles Polyproplene Narrow
Mouth Nalgene VWR Scientific Cat. No. 16067-
4412 cases of 6 [146 16067-146 118.47 236.94(2203-0005 118.00 76.70 153.40|16067-146 118.47 75.82 151.64|ST-B7514-64 126.06]|180-50499 195.42
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
45]2 each 36426-060 36426-060 11.28 22.56|36426-060 9.62 7.16 14.32|36426-060 11.28 2.82 5.64|ST-T-501-2 7.42 5.75 11.50
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
46|2 each 36427-095 36427-095 11.35 22.70(36427-095 9.68 7.21 14.42136427-095 11.35 2.84 5.68|ST-T-501-6 7.42 5.75 11.50
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
47]2 each 36427-062 36427-062 11.35 22.70(36427-062 9.68 7.21 14.42|36427-062 11.35 2.84 5.68|ST-T-501-5 7.42 5.75 11.50
12 packs of |Latex Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
481100 191302608E 19-130-2608E 18.26 219.12|19-130-2608E 18.26 12.80 153.60[82026-430 14.24 8.54 102.48|ST-8844 5.00 4.12 49.44
6 packs of
491100 Vinyl Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 19041190E |19-041-190E 20.40 122.40|19-041-190E 19.79 15.70 94.20(89042-016 23.78 11.89 71.34|ST-MDS192077 11.90 9.05 54.30
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
50|1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3 13-642-780 1,315.00 1,315.00 2115101| 1,535.00| 1,304.75| 1,304.75/11388-356 2,085.00f 1,355.25| 1,355.25|ST-H2115101 1,535.00| 1,335.00| 1,335.00
Sodium Phosphate Dibasic, ACS, Grade VWR
512 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. JT3828-1 JT3828-1 331.20 662.40(JT3828-1 331.20 258.02 516.04|jt3828-1 331.20 198.72 397.44|ST-3828-01 374.80 223.93 447.86
Drop-Dispenser Bottles Nalgene VWR Scientific
52|1 pack of 12|Cat. No. 16354-465 16354-465 108.26 108.26|16354-465 108.26 90.64 90.64|16354-465 108.26 37.89 37.89|ST-B7698-125 55.10 42.65 42.65
Tygon Tubing, 5/16" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness
53|1roll Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1M 14-169-1M 93.27 93.27|14-169-1M 93.27 58.97 58.97|63010-100 83.66 41.83 41.83|ST-T6010-122 116.00 75.27 75.27
Tygon Tubing, 3/8" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
54|1roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1Q 14-1691Q 115.73 115.73|14-169-1Q 115.73 73.16 73.16|63010-422 115.12 57.56 57.56
Tygon Tubing, 1/2" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
55|1 roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1U 14-169-1U 143.62 143.62|14-169-1U 143.62 90.79 90.79|63010-166 125.34 62.67 62.67|ST-T6010-7 132.00 82.53 82.53
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:

CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

American Merchandising Services

Government Scientific Source

VWR International LLC

Sat

uro Technologies, LLC

PO Box 12408

12351 Sunrise Valley Dr.

800 E. Fabyan Parkway

PIO box 23282

Cleveland, OH 44112

Reston, VA 20191

Batavia, IL 60510

Toledo, OH 43623

Brandon King

Nick Williams

Amanda Harness

Isabelle Karakas

TITLE: Vice President Sales Account Representative Quotations Supervisor President
TELEPHONE: (216) 249-2626 (800) 248-8030 (800) 932-5000 (419) 534-9870
EMAIL ADDRESS: nwilliams@govsci.com usbids@vwr.comn ikarakas@saturotechnologies.com
ITEM PRODUCT ITEM PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT ITEM UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE NUMBER LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
Nichrome Wire, 24 Gauge VWR Scientific Cat. No.
56|1 roll JT3828-1 JT3828-1 331.20 331.20|66258-124 95.53 66.65 66.65|JT3828-1 331.20 165.60 165.60
Kimax Volumetric Flask, 2000 ml Kimble No.
57|1 case of 4 |28008-2000 28008-2000 279.04 279.04|28008-2000 278.04 187.68 187.68|89001-860 278.04 180.73 180.73|ST-F7404-76 286.00 236.28 236.28
Kimax Heavy Duty Beakers, 1000 ml Kimble No.
58|1 case of 6 |14005-1000 14005-1000 147.30 147.30/14005-1000 430.41 290.53 290.53|89001-080 156.02 78.01 78.01|ST-B7400-15 438.00 100.00 100.00
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
59|1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3 13-642-780 1,315.00 1,315.00 2115101| 1,535.00f 1,304.75| 1,304.75|11388-356 2,085.00f 1,355.25| 1,355.25|ST-H2115101 1,535.00| 1,335.00| 1,335.00
2 packs of |Nalgene griffin Beakers, 150 ml Manufacture No.
60|12 1201-0150 1201-0150 67.42 134.84|02-591-10C 67.42 52.70 105.40]|13915-090 94.69 33.14 66.28|ST-B2730-150 50.40 37.30 74.60

Prepared by Purchasing

Additional shipping charges are 10% of orders
greater than $2,500.00

Estimated Freight $550. Estimated Hazard Charge
$45. Estimates based on purchase of entire quote.
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:

CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Cynmar Corporation

Fisher Scientific Co. LLC

Apple Scientific

A. Daigger & Company

PO Box 530

4500 Turnberry Drive, Suite A

PO Box 778

620 Lakeview Parkway

Carlinville, IL 62626

Hanover Park, IL 60133

Chesterland, OH 44026

Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Linda Vana Huyear

Angela Ponder

Susan Myers

Meghan O'Connell

TITLE: National Sales Manager Sen. Quoter CSR Account Manager
TELEPHONE: (800) 233-3517 (800) 766-7000 (800) 932-3056 (800) 621-7193 x 7217
EMAIL ADDRESS: linda@cynmar.com fs.order@thermofisher.com susan@applesci.com moconnell@diagger.com
ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE | PRICE | PRICE |ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE | PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
45 packs of |Pall Life Science Petri Dishes with Pads Pall No.
1/100 7245 PD2004750 66.00] 54.45| 1,633.50 7245 42.22 31.46| 1,415.70 7245 41.77 34.20| 1,539.00
4 packs of
21000 Pall Life Science Membrane Filters Pall No. 66068 NC9121497 458.94| 458.94| 1,835.76 66068 430.66 305.00f 1,220.00 66068 416.10 340.001 1,360.00
Sterilization Wrap Autoclavable, 18" X 18" Fisher
3|6 cases Scientific Cat. No. 191500010 191500010 103.69| 67.40 404.40{19-150-0010 103.69 54.70 328.20{JX1009D 144.00 85.00 510.00
4 cases of |Disposable Culture Dishes Fisher Scientific Cat.
4(500 No. 08-757-12 150-23318 70.00] 70.00] 280.00 875712 179.00| 71.60 286.40|08-757-12 179.00 96.00 384.00|EF7159B 89.00 55.00 220.00
2 packs of |ATI Sterilometer VWR Scientific Cat. No. 34010-
5[200 034 1188911 6.87 4.12 8.24|34010-034 32.25 23.95 47.90]JX9907 43.50 35.00 70.00
Autoclave Indicator Tape Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
6[10 rolls 15-904 15904 5.69 4.27 42.70(15-904 5.69 4.79 47.90|JX14826B 7.25 2.50 25.00
2 cases of |French Square Bottles, clear wide mouth Fisher
7124 Scientific Cat. No. 02911389 115-55324 38.40| 36.48 72.96 2911389 155.13| 69.81 139.62]02-911-389 155.13 90.00 180.00|56108-738-26 155.00 30.00 60.00
1 cases of [Coliform Sampling Containers with tablet Corning
8[100 No. 1700-100 973091 66.04| 52.83 52.83]|1700-100 65.93 52.00 52.00|1700-100 66.00 45.50 45.50
10 packs of |Autoclavable Rubber Lined Screw Caps VWR
9|12 Scientific Cat. No. 16215-130 2911864 1,937.26| 678.04| 6,780.40|16215-130 28.03 9.90 99.00{5095/12 28.03 10.00 100.00
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
10|1 each No. 15-059-337 15059337 53.02| 34.46 34.46|ACCR0201S 53.02 32.00 32.00|JX24030E 56.00 28.00 28.00
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
11|4 each No. 15-059-329 15059329 53.01| 34.46 137.84|ACCI0301$ 53.02 32.00 128.00|JX24030B 87.00 27.00 108.00
Autoclave Thermometer VWR Scientific Cat. No.
12|1 each 61069-996 NO BID 91069-996 53.61 35.95 35.95|JX23997B 39.50 16.00 16.00
1/4 |b. Bottle of M-Endo Broth MF Difco No.
13|7 each 0749024 Difco Cat. No. DF 0749-15 DF0749159 63.76] 57.38 401.66 749024 65.08 49.75 348.23|BD274920 63.75 50.00 350.00
100 g Bottle of Brillant Green Bile 2% BBL Cat. No.
14|1 each 11079 DF0007156 67.73| 60.96 60.96 11079 68.44 53.00 53.00|BD273000 35.00 27.50 27.50
15|1 each 500 gram Bottle of EC Broth BBL Cat. No. 11187 NO BID 11187 123.22 82.00 82.00|BD231430 119.10 84.50 84.50
1/4 Ib. Bottles of Plate Count Agar Difco Cat. No.
16|12 each 0479-15 DF0479155 46.17 41.55 498.60|0479-15 46.89 36.50 438.00|BD247930 46.00 36.00 432.00
1/4 Bottle of Lauryl Tryptose Broth Difco Cat. No.
17|1 each 0241-15 DF0241152 67.73] 60.96 60.96]|0241-15 68.44 53.00 53.00|BD224140 67.00 53.50 53.50
1/4 Bottles of Tryptic Soy Broth Difco Cat. No.
18|13 each 0370-15 DF0370155 26.12| 23.51 305.63|0370-15 26.34 21.00 273.00|BD211824 26.00 20.00 260.00
7 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
19|1 case SB109-500 SB109500 415.54| 241.01 241.04|$B109-500 415.54 215.00 275.00{JX12135B 126.00 45.00 45.00
10 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat.
20|2 case No. SB141-500 SB141500 389.76| 226.06 452.12|$B141-500 389.76 256.00 512.00{JX12135C 126.00 45.00 90.00

Prepared by Purchasing
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BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

NAME: Cynmar Corporation Fisher Scientific Co. LLC Apple Scientific A. Daigger & Company
MAILING ADDRESS: PO Box 530 4500 Turnberry Drive, Suite A PO Box 778 620 Lakeview Parkway
CITY, STATE, ZIP: Carlinville, IL 62626 Hanover Park, IL 60133 Chesterland, OH 44026 Vernon Hills, IL 60061
CONTACT PERSON: Linda Vana Huyear Angela Ponder Susan Myers Meghan O'Connell
TITLE: National Sales Manager Sen. Quoter CSR Account Manager
TELEPHONE: (800) 233-3517 (800) 766-7000 (800) 932-3056 (800) 621-7193 x 7217
EMAIL ADDRESS: linda@cynmar.com fs.order@thermofisher.com susan@applesci.com moconnell@diagger.com
ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE | PRICE | PRICE |ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE | PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
1,2-Cyclohexylenedinitritotetraacetic Acid ACS,
21]2 bottles Grade 500 grams Spectrum Cat. No. C1466-500 AC155001000 125.90| 119.61 239.22|NO BID NO BID
Ferrous Ammonium Sulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher
22|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 177-500 177500 204.02| 112.21 112.21]177-500 204.02 101.00 101.00|NO BID
Sodium Thiosulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher Scientific
23|1 each Cat. No. S445-500 S445500 69.86 38.42 38.42($445-500 69.86 35.00 35.00|NO BID
10 cases of |Sodium Chloride, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific Cat.
2416 No. BDH0286-500G S271500 221.67| 133.00] 1,330.00|BDH0286-500 84.01 57.25 572.50|NO BID
Sodium Hydroxide Pellets, ACS, Grade VWR
25]3 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. BDH0292-500G AC424335000 197.88| 197.88 593.64|BDH0292-500G 116.04 86.75 260.25|BDH0292-50043 40.00 29.25 351.00
Potassium Phosphate Monobasic, ACS, Grade
26]2 case of 4 |VWR Scientific Cat. No. BDH0266-500G P288500 843.06| 379.38 758.76|BDH0266-500G 232.53 135.00 270.00|NO BID
Hydrochloric Acid 37%, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
272 cases of 6 |Cat. No. EM-HX0603-3 MHX06033 288.59| 158.72 317.44|EM-HX0603-3 166.37 128.00 256.00|EM-HX0603-13 55.00 31.00 372.00
Glacial Acetic Acid, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
28]1 case of 6 |Cat. No. MK312104 MK3121500 585.37| 321.95 321.95|MK312104 286.55 195.75 195.75|NO BID
Ammonium Hydroxide, ACS, Grade Fisher
29]2 bottles Scientific Cat. No. A669-212 A669212 142.52| 78.39 156.78|A669-212 142.52 93.25 186.50|NO BID
Thermo/Orion Ross Refrence Electrode Single
30{1 box Junction Fill Solution Model No. 900001 13641899 86.11| 77.50 77.50 900001 84.00 63.00 63.00 900001 84.00 68.00 68.00
Thermo/Ross PH Electrode with BNC Connector
31]|2 each Model No. 8101BNWP 13642236 260.91| 234.82 469.64|8101BNWP 258.00 193.50 387.00/8101BNWP 258.00 205.00 410.00
Thermo/Ross Reference Electrode Double
32]|2 each Junction Model No. 800500 13620273 220.77| 165.58 331.16 800500 268.00 201.00 402.00 800500 199.00 157.00 314.00
Thermo/Orion Flouride Electrode with BNC
33|1 each Connector Model No. 9409BN 13641942 601.00| 540.90 540.90{9409BN 601.00 450.75 450.75|9409BN 601.00 475.00 475.00
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Single
34]1 each Junction Model No. 900100 13641898 188.00| 169.20 169.20 900100 188.00 141.00 141.00 900100 188.00 149.00 149.00
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Double
35|1 each Junction Model No. 900200 13641900 227.00| 204.30 204.30 900200 227.00 170.25 170.25 900200 227.00 179.00 179.00
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
36|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 02202B 02202B 109.40| 38.29 38.29]25433-102 76.31 27.00 27.00|JX14251B 67.00 15.00 15.00
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
37|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 08732117 111-20967 45.00| 42.75 42.75 8732117 97.30 34.06 34.06/08-732-117 97.30 54.00 54.00|JX14198B 74.00 35.00 35.00
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
38]2 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-362 89012362 511.88| 460.69 921.38(89012-362 97.37 60.00 120.00|3640-0010 88.25 48.00 96.00
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:

CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Cynmar Corporation

Fisher Scientific Co. LLC

Apple Scientific

A. Daigger & Company

PO Box 530

4500 Turnberry Drive, Suite A

PO Box 778

620 Lakeview Parkway

Carlinville, IL 62626

Hanover Park, IL 60133

Chesterland, OH 44026

Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Linda Vana Huyear

Angela Ponder

Susan Myers

Meghan O'Connell

TITLE: National Sales Manager Sen. Quoter CSR Account Manager
TELEPHONE: (800) 233-3517 (800) 766-7000 (800) 932-3056 (800) 621-7193 x 7217
EMAIL ADDRESS: linda@cynmar.com fs.order@thermofisher.com susan@applesci.com moconnell@diagger.com
ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE | PRICE | PRICE |ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE | PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
39|3 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-364 89012364 262.50| 236.25 708.75|89012-364 103.80 64.00 192.00]3640-0025 95.06 60.00 180.00
Ultrapure Cartridges Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
40]8 each 0903525 ABR-70742 101.00| 95.95| 767.60 903525 117.00| 87.75 702.00|09-035-25 117.00 86.58 692.64|BSSD8902 117.00 85.00 680.00
2 cases of |Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
41]12 16651926 0340914C 114.50 85.88 171.76]16651-926 115.03 82.50 165.00]2405-1000 114.50 70.25 140.50
Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
42]2 packs of 416651595 0340910E 34.26| 25.70 51.40]16651-595 48.12 18.75 37.50|2402-0500 22.83 14.50 29.00
Nalgene Carboy with spigot and handle VWR
43]1 each Scientific Cat. No. 16334-220 02963BB 195.75| 117.45 117.45]16334-220 289.60 111.50 111.50]16334-220 130.50 83.00 83.00
Boston Round Bottles Polyproplene Narrow
Mouth Nalgene VWR Scientific Cat. No. 16067-
442 cases of 6 |146 02924A 117.75 94.20 188.40|16067-146 118.47 69.50 139.00]2203-0005 117.75 72.00 144.00
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
45]2 each 36426-060 568147 33.05| 14.87 29.74136426-060 11.35 7.45 14.90(JX148308B 5.16 2.50 5.00
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
46|2 each 36427-095 1590110F 29.30 13.19 26.38|36427-095 11.35 7.50 15.00{JX14830F 5.16 2.50 5.00
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
47]2 each 36427-062 1590110E 29.30| 13.19 26.38|36427-062 11.35 7.50 15.00{JX14830E 5.16 2.50 5.00
12 packs of |Latex Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
48]100 191302608E 180-50546 11.00] 10.81| 129.72]|1146268E 53.20 21.28 255.36132916-538 16.56 11.30 135.60]JX4978P 14.00 4.75 57.00
6 packs of
491100 Vinyl Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 19041190E |180-50499 7.50| 7.13 42.78|19041190E 20.40 8.16 48.96/19041190E 20.40 15.68 94.08]JX110806D 16.50 3.60 21.60
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
50|1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3 NO BID 2115101| 1,535.00f 1,110.00f 1,110.00{0920A3 2,915.00] 2,250.00| 2,250.00
Sodium Phosphate Dibasic, ACS, Grade VWR
512 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. JT3828-1 5374500 488.34| 268.59 537.18|JT3828-1 331.20 246.00 492.00|JTB3828-1 80.00 45.00 360.00
Drop-Dispenser Bottles Nalgene VWR Scientific
52|1 pack of 12|Cat. No. 16354-465 3006 77.07| 46.24 46.24|16354-465 108.26 42.00 42.00[2411-0125 51.37 32.00 32.00
Tygon Tubing, 5/16" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness
53|1roll Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1M 141691M 93.27| 51.30 51.30|14-169-1M 83.16 50.00 50.00|AAC00022 88.00 46.00 46.00
Tygon Tubing, 3/8" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
54|1 roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1Q 141691Q 115.73| 63.65 63.65[14-169-1Q 115.73 69.00 69.00|AAC00027 105.00 54.00 54.00
Tygon Tubing, 1/2" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
55|1 roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1U 141691U 143.62| 78.99 78.99]14-169-1U 132.69 70.00 70.00|AAC000036 125.50 65.00 65.00
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:

CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Cynmar Corporation

Fisher Scientific Co. LLC

Apple Scientific

A. Daigger & Company

PO Box 530

4500 Turnberry Drive, Suite A

PO Box 778

620 Lakeview Parkway

Carlinville, IL 62626

Hanover Park, IL 60133

Chesterland, OH 44026

Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Linda Vana Huyear

Angela Ponder

Susan Myers

Meghan O'Connell

TITLE: National Sales Manager Sen. Quoter CSR Account Manager
TELEPHONE: (800) 233-3517 (800) 766-7000 (800) 932-3056 (800) 621-7193 x 7217
EMAIL ADDRESS: linda@cynmar.com fs.order@thermofisher.com susan@applesci.com moconnell@diagger.com
ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL PRODUCT UNIT TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE | PRICE | PRICE |ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE | PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE ITEM NUMBER| LIST PRICE PRICE PRICE
Nichrome Wire, 24 Gauge VWR Scientific Cat. No.
56]1 roll JT3828-1 595976D 20.25| 20.25 20.25|66258-124 95.53 44.00 44.00|NO BID
Kimax Volumetric Flask, 2000 ml Kimble No.
57|1 case of 4 |28008-2000 101991K 279.04| 223.23 223.23|28008-2000 278.04 171.00 171.00]28008-2000 278.04 180.00 180.00
Kimax Heavy Duty Beakers, 1000 ml Kimble No.
58|1 case of 6 |14005-1000 115-33036 90.00| 85.50 85.50/0255520E 430.41| 322.81 322.81|14005-1000 147.30 108.00 108.00|14005-10000 109.35 67.00 67.00
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
59]1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3 NO BID 2115101| 1,535.00f 1,110.00f 1,110.00|{0920A3 2,915.00f 2,280.00| 2,280.00
2 packs of |Nalgene griffin Beakers, 150 ml Manufacture No.
60|12 1201-0150 0259110C 67.42 37.08 74.16|1201-015U 94.69 35.00 70.00|1201-0150 45.00 28.00 56.00
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NAME:

MAILING ADDRESS:
CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:
TITLE:

TELEPHONE:
EMAIL ADDRESS:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Ultra Scientific, Inc.

250 Smith Street

North Kingstown, Rl 02852

Devynn Fagre

Customer Service Deaprtment

(800) 388-1754

csr@ultrasci.com

ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE PRICE PRICE
45 packs of |Pall Life Science Petri Dishes with Pads Pall No.
1/100 7245
4 packs of
2]|1000 Pall Life Science Membrane Filters Pall No. 66068
Sterilization Wrap Autoclavable, 18" X 18" Fisher
3|6 cases Scientific Cat. No. 191500010
4 cases of |Disposable Culture Dishes Fisher Scientific Cat.
41500 No. 08-757-12
2 packs of |ATI Sterilometer VWR Scientific Cat. No. 34010-
5[200 034
Autoclave Indicator Tape Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
6[10 rolls 15-904
2 cases of |French Square Bottles, clear wide mouth Fisher
7|24 Scientific Cat. No. 02911389
1 cases of [Coliform Sampling Containers with tablet Corning
8[100 No. 1700-100
10 packs of |Autoclavable Rubber Lined Screw Caps VWR
9|12 Scientific Cat. No. 16215-130
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
10]1 each No. 15-059-337
Exact-Temp Thermometer Fisher Scientific Cat.
11|4 each No. 15-059-329
Autoclave Thermometer VWR Scientific Cat. No.
12|1 each 61069-996
1/4 |b. Bottle of M-Endo Broth MF Difco No.
13|7 each 0749024 Difco Cat. No. DF 0749-15
100 g Bottle of Brillant Green Bile 2% BBL Cat. No.
14|1 each 11079
15|1 each 500 gram Bottle of EC Broth BBL Cat. No. 11187
1/4 Ib. Bottles of Plate Count Agar Difco Cat. No.
16|12 each 0479-15
1/4 Bottle of Lauryl Tryptose Broth Difco Cat. No.
17|1 each 0241-15
1/4 Bottles of Tryptic Soy Broth Difco Cat. No.
18|13 each 0370-15
7 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
19]1 case SB109-500
10 PH Buffer Concentrate Fisher Scientific Cat.
20|2 case No. SB141-500
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:
CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:
TITLE:

TELEPHONE:
EMAIL ADDRESS:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Ultra Scientific, Inc.

250 Smith Street

North Kingstown, Rl 02852

Devynn Fagre

Customer Service Deaprtment

(800) 388-1754

csr@ultrasci.com

ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE PRICE PRICE
1,2-Cyclohexylenedinitritotetraacetic Acid ACS,
21|2 bottles Grade 500 grams Spectrum Cat. No. C1466-500
Ferrous Ammonium Sulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher
22|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 177-500
Sodium Thiosulfate, ACS, Grade Fisher Scientific
23|1 each Cat. No. S445-500
10 cases of |Sodium Chloride, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific Cat.
2416 No. BDH0286-500G
Sodium Hydroxide Pellets, ACS, Grade VWR
25]3 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. BDH0292-500G
Potassium Phosphate Monobasic, ACS, Grade
26]2 case of 4 |VWR Scientific Cat. No. BDH0266-500G
Hydrochloric Acid 37%, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
27]2 cases of 6 |Cat. No. EM-HX0603-3
Glacial Acetic Acid, ACS, Grade VWR Scientific
28]1 case of 6 |Cat. No. MK312104
Ammonium Hydroxide, ACS, Grade Fisher
292 bottles Scientific Cat. No. A669-212 INR-0710S-L 26.00] 26.00| 130.00
Thermo/Orion Ross Refrence Electrode Single
30{1 box Junction Fill Solution Model No. 900001
Thermo/Ross PH Electrode with BNC Connector
31]|2 each Model No. 8101BNWP
Thermo/Ross Reference Electrode Double
32]|2 each Junction Model No. 800500
Thermo/Orion Flouride Electrode with BNC
33|1 each Connector Model No. 9409BN
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Single
34]1 each Junction Model No. 900100
Thermo/Orion Reference Electrode Double
35|1 each Junction Model No. 900200
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
36|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 02202B
Plastic Disposable Weighing Dishes Fisher
37|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 08732117
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
38|2 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-362
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:
CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:
TITLE:

TELEPHONE:
EMAIL ADDRESS:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Ultra Scientific, Inc.

250 Smith Street

North Kingstown, Rl 02852

Devynn Fagre

Customer Service Deaprtment

(800) 388-1754

csr@ultrasci.com

ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE PRICE PRICE
Buret, Automatic Self Zeroing Fluoropolymer
39|3 each Resin Stopcock VWR Scientific Cat. No. 89012-364
Ultrapure Cartridges Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
40]8 each 0903525
2 cases of |Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
41]12 16651926
Nalgene Wash Bottles VWR Scientific Cat. No.
42]2 packs of 4116651595
Nalgene Carboy with spigot and handle VWR
43|1 each Scientific Cat. No. 16334-220
Boston Round Bottles Polyproplene Narrow
Mouth Nalgene VWR Scientific Cat. No. 16067-
442 cases of 6 |146
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
45]2 each 36426-060
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
46]2 each 36427-095
Laboratory Labeling Tape VWR Scientific Cat. No.
47]2 each 36427-062
12 packs of |Latex Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No.
481100 191302608E
6 packs of
49]100 Vinyl Gloves Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 19041190E
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
50]1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3
Sodium Phosphate Dibasic, ACS, Grade VWR
51]2 cases of 4 |Scientific Cat. No. JT3828-1
Drop-Dispenser Bottles Nalgene VWR Scientific
52]1 pack of 12|Cat. No. 16354-465
Tygon Tubing, 5/16" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness
53]1roll Fisher Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1M
Tygon Tubing, 3/8" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
5411 roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1Q
Tygon Tubing, 1/2" ID 1/16" Wall Thickness Fisher
55]1 roll Scientific Cat. No. 14-169-1U
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NAME:
MAILING ADDRESS:
CITY, STATE, ZIP:
CONTACT PERSON:
TITLE:

TELEPHONE:
EMAIL ADDRESS:

BID TABULATION FOR 2009 LAB SUPPLIES QUOTATION -- AUGUST 17, 2009

Ultra Scientific, Inc.

250 Smith Street

North Kingstown, Rl 02852

Devynn Fagre

Customer Service Deaprtment

(800) 388-1754

csr@ultrasci.com

ITEM PRODUCT LIST UNIT | TOTAL
NUMBER | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ITEM NUMBER| PRICE PRICE PRICE
Nichrome Wire, 24 Gauge VWR Scientific Cat. No.
56|1 roll JT3828-1
Kimax Volumetric Flask, 2000 ml Kimble No.
57]1 case of 4 |28008-2000
Kimax Heavy Duty Beakers, 1000 ml Kimble No.
58]1 case of 6 |14005-1000
Thermo Scientific Orion PH/MV/ISE Bench Top
59]1 each Meter 920A Plus Manufacture No. 0920A3
2 packs of |Nalgene griffin Beakers, 150 ml Manufacture No.
60[12 1201-0150
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